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Making Wood Work:
Value Added Policies and Programs

Executive Summary
TIle Northwest is undergoing fundamental changes in the way forest resources are
managed, grown, harvested, and manufactured into products. One way ofmaximizing
the economic benefit of the available wood supply is to add to its value through further
processing before it leaves the region. The Northwest Policy Center has reviewed
numerous existing initiatives in order to identify what types ofprograms and policies are
needed to stimulate value added wood products manufacturing in the Northwest

This repon profiles initiatives that aim to stimulate the development of the value added
wood products industry in the Northwest. in such other regions as the Northeast. and in
Sweden and Denmark. NPC contacted over 70 programs for this study, and collected
information and literature on 13 organizations in Scandinavia and Denmark.

The efforts profiled vary widely in their scope, SOllcture, and geographic coverage.
Many programs focus their efforts specifically toward the wood products industry, while
others work with many other sectors as well. Programs also vary in SOlleture; public and
private entities have formed service partnerships, state and federal programs provide
direct seJVices to the wood products industry, and private non-profit organizations have
initiated their own programs that provide technical expertise and seJVices..Groups vary
in the extent to which they have direct ties to the industry. In addition, program selVice
areas range from local to larger areas including multi-state regions.

SeJVices offered by these agencies and other entities range from technical, marketing,
and expon assistance to education and training programs; from assistance in establishing
flexible manufacturing networks to research and policy development. Training programs
offer a range of opponunities in meeting the employment needs of the wood products
industry. These programs include those that train the existing workforce, future
workforce, and displaced workers. Marketing programs provide such seJVices as market
research and information on accessing markets. flexible manufacturing network forma­
tion is a relatively new strategy where businesses have banded together to share the costs
of developing a new product or reaching additional markets. Research on silvicultural
techniques reveals ways to grow higher quality and higher valued wood. In addition,
expon assistance has been instrumental in helping small wood product firms obtain
expon fmancing and access to expon markets. Technical assistance programs provide
such seJVices as access to advanced technology, and counsel on modifying plant and
equipment

Seven elements seem key to shaping effective value added wood products initiatives:

• build public-private partnerships;

• coordinate with related and complementary programs;

• promote cooperation and communication within the industry;

• organize regionally;



• get the commitment of public leaders;

• target sectors and services; and

• be flexible. so as to meet changing industry needs.

Public-private partnerships help insure that value added programs meet the needs of the
industry they are attempting to serve. 1bese partnerships vary in such characteristics as
industry membership or boards of directors, which can insure them involvement in the
design and implementation of programs. For example, Washington's Evergreen Partner­
ship is a private non-profit organization that promotes Northwest wood products in
national and international markets. Of the 19 seats on its board of directors, 10 are
reserved for forest products and building materials representatives; nine are filled by
representatives of the public sector.

Government can also partner with companies by providing fmancial assistance to private
sector efforts. Oregon Economic Development Department's Key Industries Program
has a matching-grant program that works as an incentive for businesses to initiate
flexible manufacturing networks and has proven to be an effective strategy for govern­
ment stimulating private sector activity.

Coordination between programs promoting value added wood products manufacturing
and those addressing other aspects of the industry's competitiveness helps increase
effectiveness and efficiency. Coordinating public and private initiatives avoids duplica­
tion and better meets industry needs. For example, the Wisconsin Depanment of Natural
Resources and Forward Wisconsin, a non-profit organization that promotes the state's
key industries, work. jointly on projects aimed at strengthening the forest products
industry.

Promoting cooperation and communication within the industry helps firms identify
common problems and opportunities. Charged with promoting the secondary wood
products industry in Oregon, WPCC has formed five chapters across the state to bring
firms within the industry together. to involve them in creating WPCC programs. and to
promote networking opportunities. where companies can work. together to access
markets.

Organizing programs on a multi-state basis can enable program managers to pool efforts
and resources, thus streamlining problem solving and delivery of services. For example,
the Northeastern Forest Alliance brings together state foresters and natural resource
departments from a four state region to address issues common to Northeast forests and
the industries dependent upon them.

Support and commitment of public leaders can enhance a program's credibility as well as
advance its goals. This goes beyond funding, and includes ongoing commitments of
time and expenise. The strength of the commitment can bring about increased participa­
tion from both government and industry. can speed program stan up, and can make
certain government services are provided more smoothly

Targeting specific sectors enables programs to provide the specific expertise needed to
help wood products firms improve their competitiveness. For example the Appalachian
Export Center for Hardwoods provides marketing assistance to hardwood firms looking
to export their value added products.

Making programs flexible, so they can adapt to changes in the wood products industry is
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also an important feature of value added wood products initiatives. Keeping the door
open to new opportunities and listening to, and learning from, the industry enables
managers to detennine if they are reaching their program goals.

TIIis report highlights special initiatives, resources available to companies and other
interested parties, and provides contacts for further information. Summaries of these
value added policies and programs are included in Appendix I-VI.
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Changes in The Forest Products sector
The Pacific Northwest's timber lands are highly productive sources of softwood timber.
Some of the best softwood in the world is grown in the coastal forests ranging from
Northern California north through Oregon and Washington to British Columbia and
Alaska. Inland forests in these states and provinces, and in Alberta, Idaho, and Montana.
produce softwood timber as well, but in volumes lower than the coastal regions. The
halvest levels that have reliably supplied wood fiber to the wood products industry are
now in question, as.are the jobs of a portion of the people employed in lumber and wood
products and pulp and paper plants in the region.

The debate continues over how much of the region's forests should remain in protected
wilderness status, how much should be available for halvesting, and what the yearly
halvest level should be. In every part of the Northwest which depends on the timber
industry, the future of that industry is threatened.

Several factors are threatening the vitality of the wood products industry. The U.S.
Forest SelVice, a major forest landowner in the Pacific Northwest states, is reducing the
allowable timber cuts on its lands throughout the region. Litigation is forcing public and
private entities in the Pacific Northwest states to reconsider their policies with respect to
timber industry activity in old growth forests. While the use of litigation is very limited
in the battle over forest use in Canada. strong public pressure on forest management
practices, forest monitoring regimes, and alternate land use demands have driven the
Canadian challenge. Litigation and the U.S. Fish and Wudlife SelVice ruling that the
northern sponed owl is a threatened species will force severely reduced halVesting rates
on federal timberland in the U.S. Reductions on state-owned and private timber are also
possible. The President's Forest Conference in April 1993 set the course for future forest
management practices and has subsequent plans to make only 1.2 billion board feet
available from federal lands.

In addition to supply changes, advances in productivity have reduced the number ofjobs
that would be generated by each million board feet processed in the region's primary
processing plants. In lumber and plywood plants, advanced material handling has
eliminated many jobs, while improved sawing and other processing has increased yields.
Many local areas dependent on timber processing have had a difficult time adjusting to
the loss of family wage factory jobs caused in part by productivity improvements.

At a time when the future supply of the Northwest's natural resources seems penna­
nently constrained, resource dependent industries are rethinking the way they utilize and
manufacture products from those resources. For the wood products industry, adding
more value is one critical way to maintain profitability and protect jobs.

While other steps are needed to deal with human problems caused by sudden changes in
harvest levels. adding more value to wood products before they leave the region is an
importantm~ of maintaining the economic vitality of timber dependent communities.
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Higher valued and higher quality wood can be grown through pruning and other silvicul­
tural methods. Commodity products can be tailored to the needs of particular customers,
resulting in cut stock rather than standard commodity lwnber. Altering production
processes can add value through additional drying or grading steps, finger jointing,
preparation ofkits for the do-it-yourself market, chemical treattnent for special applica­
tions, are among many examples. Remanufacture of lwnber products into such items as
doors, windows, engineered products for roofs or other applications is a growing oppor­
tunity for the region. Expanding foreign markets for high value wood products offer a
new market-place where new and expanding Northwest firms can grow rather than
compete against well established finns in domestic markets.

Some of these same challenges were addressed in the 1970s and 1980s in the SCandina­
vian countries. Because of changes in markets, and constraints in the supply of raw
material some segments of the industry have undergone major changes. Competition
from around the world, especially Germany and the United Kingdom, as well as the
relatively high cost of timber forced the commodity oriented Scandinavian producers to
restructure. In Sweden and Finland the sawmilling industry went through structural
changes that have resulted in companies whose processes are perhaps the most ad­
vanced in the world, and are still developing. Finns are currently producing more and
better wood products. These sawmills are responding to more demanding customers.
Buyers are better infonned about alternatives and care about environmental conse­
quences, and are placing more emphasis on economy, flexibility, and terms of delivery.
These customers care about superior products, value for money. and lasting supplier
relations.

Swedish and Finnish sawmills are committed to serve the joinery industry in supplying
products that enhance customers' competitive advantage. As a result of modernization,
more sawmills have become specialized in their production. They respond to the specific
needs of the secondary wood products industry, especially the furniture industry. These
modernized mills can also meet the strict requirements for specific products. To fulfill
the requirements for special qualities and dimensions, more grading is done during the
process, and products are dried to the specifications of secondary manufacturers.

These trends and other developments within the industry were presented at the Nordic
Timber Conference held in UmeA, Sweden in 1990. The Swedish Wood Exporter's
Association swnmarized the new practices: 'This period of adaptation is one of exten­
sive structural change, both internal and external, with the sawmills abandoning their
traditional preoccupation with raw material and production volwnes to concentrate on a
flexible, high-quality, marlcet oriented product mix. The today-strategy of the Swedish
sawmills gives quality priority over quantity and has resulted in a closer integration
between forest, sawmill and market."
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Strengthening Value Added Manufacturing
TIle wood products industry is a complex of activities ranging from growing and haIvest­
ing trees to the manufacture of primary, value added, and secondary wood products. TIle
wood products manufacturing industry can be described either by sector or product
produced. TIle utilization of wood takes place in many sectors of the economy. How­
ever, three sectors under the Standard Industrial Qassification (Sl.e.) system describe a
concentration of wood utilizing industries in the U.S.: Lumber and Wood Products
(S.I.c. eode 24), Furniture and Fixtures (S.I.c. Code 25), and Paper and Allied Products
(S.le. Code 26). In Canada, the following sectors describe similar industries: Saw,
Planing and Shingle Mills (251 ); Veneer and Plywood Mills (252); Sash, Door and
Millwork Plants (256); Miscellaneous Wood Industries (259); Household Furniture
(261); Office Furniture (264); Miscellaneous Furniture and FIXtures (266), and Pulp and
Paper Mills (271). Lumber and wood products is the largest manufacturing sector in the
Pacific Northwest, and encompasses commodity lumber and such remanufactured items
as cabinets, millwork, and containers. TIle second largest manufacturing sector is paper
and allied products. Furniture is a relatively small sector in the region. (fable 1.)

Other industries that utilize wood are relatively small segments of larger sectors. For
example wooden boat manufacturing and wooden musical insnument manufacturing are
part ofS.I.e. 37 and 39, respectively. Other segments of the economy, although not
dependent on raw fiber, are dependent on the wood products industry. An example is
manufacturers of equipment used in the wood products manufacturing process (S.I.e.
355). These industries are often referred to as tertiary manufacturers.

Primary, value added, and secondary wood products manufacturing can be defined in a
variety of ways because of the variety of products that can be produced, and because
adding value can occur at many stages. These products are generally found in sectors 24
and 25. Efforts to add value can occur at all stages, often begirming with decisions about

c

Table 1: 1990 Employment in Wood Products Sectors in the Pacific
NorthWest Economic Region.

$ector CS.l.C)

24

25

26

Total

Lumber and Wood Products

Furniture and Fixtures

Paper and Allied Products

1m
169,500

13,100

iQ.lOO
232,700

Source: Individual Employment Divisions for the Pacific Northwest Slales; Statistics Canada for British
Columbia and Alberta (Canadian sectors 251. 252, 256. and 259 were grouped with U.S. Sector 24;
sectors 261. 264. and 266 were grouped with Sector 25; sector 271 was grouped with Sector 26)
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Figure 1: Log Diagram
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which trees to log and how they are logged, sorted, and milled. A diagram of a log cut
with adding value in mind is shown in Figure 1. The Province of Albena defines value
added as "adding value to products at different processing stages, basically through the
application of more labour and capital." Albena further defines the range of value added
products as shown in Table 2. An Oregon report. A Strategic Marketing Plan For
Expanding Value-added Wood Product Manufacturing (Mater Engineering, 1989)
distinguishes the difference between primary, value-add, and secondary processors: A
PrimaI)' Processor converts logs to partially processed raw material such as lumber or
plywood, a Value-add Processor further manufactures a primary product into component
products for specific marlcets, a SecondaI)' Processor further manufactures a primary or
value-add product into a finished or end-use product.

Primary processors take solid wood, often in the fonn of logs or only slightly processed
log products, and manufacture lumber, panels, and other solid wood products. Specifica­
tions and standards govern the sizes, quality, dryness, and other aspects of the finished
products. For the most part. the output of this sector of the wood products industry is in
the fonn of products that can be described in a set of standards set by industry groups
and regulatory bodies.

Secondary manufacturing is a very diverse sector and defies easy description. The
secondary wood products industry consists of what is called "remanufacturers" and
"value added" manufacturers. Secondary manufacturers use primary wood products and
some residual materials from primary processing to produce a wide variety of finished
and semi-finished wood products including furniture, cabinets, wall and floor systems,
modular and mobile homes, doors, windows, trim boards, and specialty items. Some of
these products can be described as standardized commodity items, but many secondary
wood products are produced for relatively small, niche markets. A number of secondary
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manufacturers produce items of high design or artistic quality; these products are at the
opposite end of the spectrum from the standardized commodities characteristic of
primary manufacturing. Because of the emphasis on adding value to wood products,
some primary manufacturers are expanding to include remanufacturing and value added
manufacturing in their operations.

All of these remanufacturing activities involve adding value to wood and other inputs
through additional manufacturing. Thus, secondary manufacturing could apply to any
activity that goes beyond simple primary commodity manufacturing. Planing lumber to
produce siding or flooring materials, machine stress graded lumber, and lumber dried
beyond standard construction lumber specifications to suit remanufaeturer needs add
value but do not represent secondary manufacturing.

Throughout the region, many public and private groups are assessing the opportunities to
stimulate the secondary processing industry. British Columbia, Washington, and Oregon
have all funded market research efforts to identify value added and secondary processing
opportunities. The message of all of these market research studies is quite positive; there
are many promising markets for value added or remanufactured products around the
globe. In response, new efforts have been undertaken in this region and others to
stimulate the wood products industry.

Table 2: Categories and Examples of Value Added Wood Products.

CateQorv value Added Product

1. Rough green timbers and squares

2. Altered or Remanufactured Lumber Products

a. Dimension lumber

b. Rough lumber

3. Semi-Finished Solid Wood Blanks

4. Ready-To-Assemble (RTA) Components

Fully surfaced, kiln dried dimension
lumber graded to North American
standards.

Non-structured applications: Fence
boards. paneling, pallet stock and
other cut to order pieces.

Fully surfaced, kiln dried construction
grade material. Also pressure
treated lumber.

Manufactured and sold mostly to
furniture, window, stair and door
manufacturers. Also may include
fingerjointing and edge gluing,
drying, machining, and fmishing.

Components for furniture, windows,
stairs, and doors. Requires specialized
machinery, equipment, metal fittings,
and sophisticated packaging.

Source: Alberta Deparunent of Forestry, Lands and Wildlife, Discussion paper on Vaiue Added Strategy in
Alberta's Sawmilling Industry.
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New Value Added Industries
Summaries of some of the most successful programs that directly or indirectly target the
wood products industry are featured in the following three sections of this report. The
first section descnbes the structure of programs and the various relationships between the
public and private sector. These relationships include public-private sector partnerships,
public programs that serve the private industry, and private industry initiated programs.
The second section describes a diverse set of services offered by programs. These
include marketing, technical, and export assistance programs to training and education
initiatives, to stimulated flexible manufacturing networlcs research and policy develop­
ment The last section summarizes lessons in program design and implementation
learned as these programs continue to emerge.

Relationships Between the Public and Private Sectors

Programs that emphasize the wood products industry are operated at all levels of govern­
ment and by private non-profit organizations, private consulting firms, and regional
organizations. The characteristics of these groups differ widely, including the extent to
which they have ties to the timber industry. Many programs stress the importance of
building a strong relationship with the wood products industry, and industry involvement
in program design and implementation. Five program types are described below:
public-private partnerships, local and state governmental programs, federal initiatives,
private sector programs, and regional projects.

Public Private Partnerships

Two types of partnerships are profiled here: partnerships organized with public and
private sector representation on boards of directors from the outset, and partnerships,
usually initiated by state government, that involve the industry in an advisory capacity, or
in projects that require equal financial participation such as matching grants. Both types
of partnerships directly involve public and private sectors, coordinate efforts among
interested parties, and work to meet the needs of the industry.

An example of a union of state government and private interests is the Evergreen
Partnership, a private non-profit organization established by the State ofWashingron in
1985 to represent and serve the forest products industry. Their 19-member Board of
Directors has ten seats reserved for representatives of the forest products and building
materials industries. Two board positions are automatically filled by the agency heads of
two State of Washington departments: Natural Resources, and Trade and Economic
Development. The remaining positions are elected from their membership at large. The
Evergreen Partnership provides links between international buyers and the Pacific
Nonhwest forest products and building materials industries. Its primary purpose is to
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cooperatively aid the development and expansion of international and domestic markets
for the Pacific Northwest wood products industry.

Established by the State of Oregon in 1991, the Oregon Wood Products Competitiveness
Corporation (WPCC) is directed by owners or managers of secondary wood products
manufacturing firms. This organization is charged with assisting the state's secondary
wood products industry in becoming ..the finest. most competitive value added producer
in the world." WPCC is committed to establishing programs that directly benefit the
secondary wood products industry. WPCC publishes a bimonthly newsletter, and has
formed regional chapters, held conferences, sponsored two educational tours, and
initiated a series of seminars for producers. Originally formed as a state agency, WPCC
is now a private non-profit organization.

Within the Canada-British Columbia Partnership Agreement on Forest Resource Devel­
opment (FRDA II) the Opportunity Identification Program is designed to worlc with the
secondary and the tertiary forest product industry to encourage the development of these
components of the forest sector. The Program is co-funded between the federal and
provincial governments but also draws upon private sector support and direction for
specific initiatives. Activity includes marlcet assessment and development. assistance in
technology and product assessment, and the examination of challenges and opponunities
in the forest sector.

Forintek Canada Corporation is a joint public and private funded research agency. The
public funding is from the federal and provincial governments. Forintek works, often in
cooperation with private companies or consortia of companies, and public agencies, on
solid wood topics in resource assessment, advanced manufacturing (lumber), drying and
protection, advanced manufacturing (composites) and building systems. The worlc plan
for Forintek is established through a consultation process which involves a number of
technical advisory comminees. The process incorporates considerable flexibility through
annual review.

In British Columbia the BC Wood Specialties Group was formed in early 1989 as a joint
initiative of the federal and provincial government Financial support is provided by the
two levels of government and from approximately 70 member companies. The BCWSG
has a prescribed role to provide marlcet information and to provide education and training
required for effective management in secondary manufacturing of solid wood products.

Several examples of public-private partnerships are found in the Midwest and Eastern
United States. Forward Wisconsin is a public-private cooperative venture. Created in
1984, this private non-profit organization is funded through state and private sources and
has a board of directors that includes state and private industry representatives. Private
sector representation includes Wisconsin's utilities. banks, educational institutions,
investment and law firms, manufacturers, and a union representative. Public sector
representation includes the Governor, four state legislators, and the secretary of the
Department of Development. Forward Wisconsin has targeted ten industries, one of
which is the wood products industry. They coordinate their efforts to boost the state's
image within and outside the state, to project the state's positive business climate, and to
attract industry to Wisconsin.

In Scandinavia, the Danish Technological Institute (011) is strongly supported by both
the public and private sector. 011, based in Taastrup in the Copenhagen area and Aarhus
on the Jutland Peninsula, is a national institute for applied technology development. DTI
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is organized along industrial lines. It has a wood products department at the Aarhus
facility which is engaged in furniture design and process technology improvements. This
department worlcs closely with industrial associations and finns in Denmark to provide
assistance in technology and product design that will aid Danish finns in developing new
products and improving current ones.

One example of recent efforts to involve the private sector in state government is Oregon
Economic Development Department's (EDD) Key Industries Devewpment Program.
Established in 1991, the Program was implemented in partnership with the business
community and selected industry trade associations to initiate flexible manufacturing
networks to help individual companies worlc together to find new marlcets. One of the
key induSUies is forest products. The purpose of the initiative is to assist Oregon's Key
Industries in becoming more competitive in the marlcetplace, to increase output and
products shipped, and increase jobs and income for Oregonians.

The Key Industries Development Program has two resources available to those interested
in fonning a network.: a $10,000 matching challenge grant program that worlcs as an
incentive for businesses to initiate networlcs; and trained network. brokers to assist
businesses in network. fonnation and technical assistance. Twenty pilot networks have
been established and 37 network. brokers trained. Three networks are associated with the
forest products sector; two work. with the furniture industry (furniture design and market­
ing). the other markets equipment to the wood products industry.

Oregon EDD also operates the Regional Strategies Program. This program funds
targeted economic development strategies developed by multi-county teams of govern­
ment and industry officials.

In Washington state, the Governor's Timber Team coordinates the state's response to
industry problems. Established by Governor Booth Gardner in 1990, this team strives to
assist timber enterprises at the local level and improve social services through such steps
as extending unemployment insurance. They coordinate two groups that advise the
Governor and the legislature on the state's strategy for assisting timber dependent
communities. workers, and finns: the Governor's Inter-Agency Task Force and the
Economic Recovery Coordination Board. The task force consists of managers of state
programs serving timber dependent communities. Members of the coordination board
represent a variety of groups such as the wood products industry, county government, the
educational system, economic development councils, and labor.

State Programs

Public sector initiated programs work with and help to promote the wood products
industry and provide assistance and services to companies. They can serve a critical role
in improving access to markets and capital. and in applying advanced technology. They
can also be a source for funding and business assistance services.

One such program is the Wisconsin Department ofNatural Resources Forest Products
Vnit. The goal of this agency is to promote the better use of Wisconsin's forest resource
by strengthening its forest industry, maintaining or increasing existing jobs, and utilizing
surplus forest resources. The Forest Products Unit works with all economic development
groups and state and federal agencies. It provides the industry information on wood
availability, promotes business development, helps to establish foreign marlcets, and
provides marketing assistance.
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lhe British Columbia Forest SeIVice's Woodlot license Program is intended to improve
management on small private forest lands and to improve productivity on both small
public and private forest land parcels. 11lis Program provides private woodlot owners
with a conditional assignment ofpublic forest land in exchange for an agreed manage­
ment program for both the private and public lands.

TIle B.c. Forest Service also delivers a program designed to encourage small forest
enterprise. 'The Program is intended to provide timber access to small scale operations,
to promote the production of specialty and high value products, to generate employment,
and to demonstrate and encourage sound integrated forest management. The Small
Business Forest Enterprise Program is funded by the BC government.

The Missouri Department ofConservation works with the private industry and provides
them with technical assistance, forest resource information through their Data Center,
access to advanced technology, and education. The Department of ConseIVation has a
close working relationship with other state agencies in Missouri including the Depart­
ment of Agriculture, Department ofNatural Resources, and Department of Economic
Development Tbis agency provides technical assistance on a request baSis to all sectors
of the forest industry including rural areas dependent on the forest industry.

Federal Programs

Federal programs that emphasize the wood products industry are primarily funded by the
Forest SeIVice in the US Department of Agriculture, and include educational, research,
and technical assistance programs. The educational and research programs funded by the
government include the USDA Cooperative Extension SeIVice program. Other Forest
SeIVice programs include the Forest Products Lab in Madison, Wisconsin and the Forest
Service Experiment Stations. Many of these projects provide research assistance and
funding that may not otherwise be available without the involvement of the federal
government.

One national effort. the National Timber Bridge Initiative was developed in response to a
need to repair or replace deteriorating highway bridges, and to improve and revitalize
rural economies. Through that investment initiated in 1989, the initiative improves rural
transportation networks, expands the range of markets for wood products, and creates
service industries for wood bridge construction. Many of these deteriorating bridges are
on double lane, rural roads, and are suited for wood construction now that technological
advances have taken timber bridge construction to a new level. Advances in timber bri­
dge design, and treatment and preservation of wood have contributed to this opportunity.

Through demonstration projects, over 200 bridges have been constructed of wood, and
they have proven to be a cost effective alternative to bridges constructed out of concrete
and steel. Most of the research takes place at the Forest Products Lab in Madison,
Wisconsin. Aspects of the research"include design criteria. sources of hardwood struc­
turallumber, construction methodologies, and monitoring the performance of demonstra­
tion projects. The Timber Bridge Information Resource Center provides access to
information on emerging technologies, and other reports and publications. It also
provides coordination of conferences. workshops, and seminars. Economic diversity and
community stability is enhanced through emphasizing under-utilized wood in a new
product, creating local jobs and long-term employment prospects, and creating additional
service industries.

14



'The timber programs of the USDA Extension Services are aimed primarily at owners and
users of private lands, and are coordinated with many groups interested in managing
renewable natural resources. 'The Extension Service's educational programs on the
renewable natural resources challenges reach landowners, resource-based companies,
communities, the public, and natural resource professionals. Extension efforts include
the development of a computerized hardwood veneer quality control program in North
Carolina, environmental education through public broadcasting in Maine, and continuing
education programs in Minnesota, New Hampshire, and New York:.

The Small-Scale Forestry Program under the Canada-British Columbia Partnership
Agreement on Forest Resource Development (FRDA II) is designed to provide profes­
sional forestry advice and funding to small-scale woodland owners. This support is
provided to improve the planning and sound management on these private woodlands.
The Program is delivered by the Canadian Forest Service.

One response to the transition underway in the forest products industry has been the
formation of the Western Wood Products Forwn in British Columbia. The WWPF is a
joint venture of some of the major forest companies in BC and the IWA-Canada 'The
mandate is to develop solutions to problems and issues affecting employment and
visibility in the industry (including silviculture, logging, and both primary and secondary
manufacturing).

Private Sector Programs

Private sector efforts to meet the needs of the wood products industry include consulting
firms, trade associations, networks or cooperatives of wood products firms, and private
non-profit organizations that are industry led.

An example of a cooperative of secondary wood product manufacturers is the Specialty
Wood Products Cooperative ofSouthwest Oregon. This recently formed, multi-county
marketing cooperative resulted from a series of meetings beginning in late 1991 that
brought a broad-based group ofpeople together to advance the prospects of the hard­
wood industry. Funding is from the Wood Products Credit Union, the Umpqua Commu­
nity Development Corporation, and the Oregon state legislature.

'The Puget Sound Cooperative Federation in Seattle is an association of consumers and
worker owned businesses that helps foster the success of cooperative enterprises within
Washington, Oregon, and Alaska. The Federation provides business assistance in many
areas including: organizational development; short and long range planning; market
analysis; business plan development; financial training; problem solving methods;
decision-making models; board training; and management system design.

Overseas Strategic Services (OSS) is located in Oregon, and is a private international
management firm that offers timber processors and other U.S. firms direct hands-on
assistance in entering the European market. Marketing services to small and medium
sized firms include: identification and evaluation of specialized distributors; competitor
and market intelligence; establishment and staffing oflocal offices: and introductions to
important professional service providers. 'This consulting service also seeks establish­
ment of strategic alliances between U.S. and European firms.

Flexible manufacturing networks (FMN) are groups of small manufacturers that come
together to jointly produce items for custom or niche markets that none could produce
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individually. This model is an adaptation of economic structures which have led to
significant economic growth in northern Italy. One such networlc is WoodNet in Port
Angeles, Washington. WoodNet serves about 300 very diverse producers in four
counties on the Olympic Peninsula. 1bis non-profit organization provides a variety of
services to its members including marketing assistance and organization of working
sessions for members with similar processes and marlcets. TIle sub-groups include: arts
& crafts; construction products; millworlc and mouldings; marine products; and home
furnishings and fixtures. WoodNet has participated in various locaL state, and interna­
tional trade shows to promote products, and they have produced an Olympic Peninsula
conswner products wholesale catalog. Additional activities include publishing a newslet­
ter informing members and helping them with demonstration projects.

In British Columbia private companies in secondary manufacturing of wood products
have formed associations to promote common interests. These associations include the
Independent Lumber Remanufacturers' Association and the Interior Value Added Wood
Association. Funding is raised from member companies.

Snickericentral, in SkellefteA, Sweden (literally tnmslates as Joinery Center) is a non­
profit corporation formed by 17 companies in 1959. 1bis group of competitive and
complementary firms prefer to concentrate on the manufacturing process rather than on
marlceting, and decided to form a subsidiary to do all of their marketing. An additional
motivation was pooling resources to meet the high costs of marlceting in Stockholm, 850
kilometers to the south, or points further away. All member firms are located near
SkellefteA and Umcl in northern Sweden. The owner companies come out of a long
tradition ofjoinery. At present, the group manufactures doors, windows, institutional
furniture, floors, and stairs. They have a high state of technology, including Computer
Aided Design (CAD) systems. Earlier in their history they did a lot of residential
construction worlc, but now specialize in their present marlcets plus "combination
products" which use the capabilities of more than one of the member companies.

Regional Programs

Several organizations in the East and Midwest operate in multi-state areas. They work
closely with and coordinate programs within their region. These include the Appalachian
Regional Commission (ARC) which covers a 13 state area, and other smaller organiza­
tions such as the Northeastern Forest Alliance which covers a four state area, and
Northeast Wood Products Exhibition (NEWPEX) which covers the Northeastern states.
Regional programs seek to avoid duplication on issues confronted by the states. By
worlcing together with each other and state organizations, pooling efforts, and sharing
expertise and knowledge of tile industry, they worlc more effectively.

The Northeastern Forest Alliance (NEFA) is a private non-profit organization formed in
1986 through a Memorandum of Understanding between the four states of Maine, New
Hampshire, Vermont, and New Yorlc. The staff and structure ofNEFA resulted from the
efforts of the four state foresters working together to form this organization. The forest­
ers recognized early on that the four states could do more as a group to address their
common forest and wood product issues, opportunities, and goals.

The regional pact represents an innovative attempt to create an awareness of the North­
east forest's resources and to market them by expanding export opponunities. Other
NEFA goals are to focus attention on natural resource issues and opportunities that
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transcend political boundaries, support a regional approach to forest planning, and share
teclmical expertise in order to streamline problem solving and delivery of services.

The state foresters from each of the four states make up the board and the natural
resource departments provide staff for the OIganizatiOn. The staff is called the "Tech­
Team" ofNEFA. Although the emphasis atNEFA is in the area ofutilization and
mark-eting, the foresters that make up the Tech-Team specialize in areas such as forest
management, forest resource planning, and forest product utilization. The Tech-Team
meets about five times a year, and the projects and agenda for this organization are
determined with input from all members. NEFA also represents the four state region in
domestic and international trade shows. 1brough ongoing communication, and partici­
pation in local forums, NEFA has brought together a wide variety of interests and
organized groups. NEFA works directly with state agencies within their region, as well
as with other federal agencies, and other regional entities. For example NEFA and
CONEG (Coalition ofNortheastern Governors) co-sponsored a wood pellet conference
in June 1993.

The Appalachian Regional Commission (ARC) is a federally funded commission that
works directly with the Governors' offices in 13 states. ARC has a total budget of about
$197 million that is allocated to highway and community development programs. The
majority of the funding goes to the highway program. Within the community develop­
ment program are initiatives that emphasize the wood products industry. About $26
million in funds are allocated through a specific formula to the 13 states, and are
matched by the states.

ARC has an indirect relationship with the private sector when it comes to wood prod­
ucts related projects. Funding decisions are made by each state. Some recent individual
state projects related to the wood products industry have involved such issues as
overcoming capital constraints, increasing technology transfer, and accessing export
markets for small producers.

Services Offered to Add Value

For firms to produce and manufacture high value wood products more efficiently, have
a greater production capacity, employ a highly skilled workforce, and sell products in
foreign and domestic markets, they must have access to information and specialized
assistance. Meeting the diverse needs of an industry is one challenge in program
design. The Virginia Center for Innovative Technology at Wytheville Community
College found that a needs assessment sUlvey is a good place to start. With this knowl­
edge about the needs of the industry, they not only designed a program to meet those
needs, but the program also built a strong, long-term, relationship with primary wood
products manufacturers one on one.

Training and Education

Training programs and services to increase the prospects of value added enterprises
range from formal college courses to informal training seminars. A variety of programs
are reaching the diverse needs of the industry including seminars to help businesses
restructure, teclmical seminars on the latest equipment, flexible manufacturing network
broker training programs, entrepreneurial training, and college courses on furniture
production.
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TIle public education system in British Coluinbia offers a variety of degrees, diplomas.
cenificates, apprenticeship preparation and individual courses related to forestry produc­
tion. practices, management and marketing. 1bese include a number ofcourses at
tectmical colleges dealing to specific aspects of secondary manufacturing in wood
products. .

1be BC Wood Specialty Group, in cooperation with the regional research and educa­
tional agencies designs and delivers seminars and workshops to upgrade the technical,
business and marketing skills of member companies. These have included management
skills, lumber grading, kiln drying, moulding and fingeIjointing machinery courses.

At Catawba Valley Conununity College in Hickory, Nonh Carolina, students can choose
between two degree programs: furniture production management, and furniture design
and development An apprenticeship-type program is offered where firms sponsor
students, and students work at the firm and take classes at the college. Students receive
practical and applied experience through their work and classes. Through the apprentice­
ship-type program students acquire basic skills (English, math, social sciences, electives)
and job specific skills (product development, drafting, production and machinery,
computers) through their classes, and this is reinforced by practical hands-on experience
at wood products manufacturing firms.

Marketing and Export Assistance

Marketing assistance and market research programs help many firms to access markets,
and identify value added products. They can link. processors with products and markets,
and expand their production options.

The BC Wood Specialties Group completes an initial identification of export market
opportunities for secondary wood products and works with member companies to design
market assessment and development missions. These missions are typically delivered in
cooperation with government officers stationed in the target market. The BCWSDG also
produces and distributes informational material on secondary wood products available
from member companies.

The BC Wood Specialties Group completes an initial identification of export market
opportunities for secondary wood products and works with member companies to design
market assessment and development missions. These missions are typically delivered in
cooperation with government officers stationed in the target market. The BCWSDG also
produces and distributes informational material on secondary wood products available
from member companies.

The Economic Development Association ofSkagit County in Mt Vernon, Washington
offers services in the areas of market development, business and technical training, and
flexible manufacturing network formation. This group sponsors business and technical
assistance workshops for new and established wood products manufacturers. They
match manufacturers with new markets, and facilitate networking among local manufac­
turers to locate timber resources and secure financing.

ln order to effectively market its services to Danish indusUy, the Danish Technological
Institute (DTI) relies on direct marketing efforts of its professional staff, who function
much like the staffof major U.S. technically oriented contract research institutions such
as the Battelle Memorial Institute or SRI International. In addition, on works closely
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with Technology Infonnation Centers (TICs) located in each of Derunarlc's 14 counties.
1lle mission of each TIC is to get to know each of the manufacturing finns in its county
through personal visits made by staff who are experienced industrial consultants. TIC
staff provide several days of free consulting advice to finns on how to improve their
process teelmology. Ifadditional assiStance is required,·the TIC staff recommend a
consultant at DTI or elsewhere who can provide the service.

Assistance in accessing foreign marlcets is a service that is valuable to small and medium
sized finns that may not have the expertise, time, or funds to develop such opponunities
themselves. 1lle Export Assistance Center (EAC) in Washington State is a private non­
profit organization that provides assistance in obtaining export financing for small and
mid-size businesses. EAC makes available financial expertise, assistance, and counsel­
ing to all small and mid-size companies that don't have the capacity to secure sound
export financing.

Through economic development organizations in Washington, the EAC delivers export
transaction training and export finance counseling. 1lle Pacific Nonhwest Export
Assistance Project of the EAC finds international marlcets, develops complete marlceting
plans, and guides companies through all facets of international trade to succeed in closing
deals. This project works with small to medium sized manufacturers who could poten­
tially increase exports or who find it difficult to enter the exporting arena The project
provides them with the step-by-step guidance they need to transfonn their finns to
successful international exporters.

Flexible Manufacturing Networks

Small manufacturers often need to pool resources and modernize if they are to compete
in today's marlcet A flexible network is a group of three or more finns which have
banded together to carry out some new business activity that the members of the network
could not pursue independently. The network can involve similar finns which band
together to share the costs of developing a new product or marlcet, or dissimilar but
complementary finns which collectively approach the capability of a vertically integrated
large finn. Typically the nature of the cooperation within the network is carefully
defined so as to preserve each finn's independence and original lines of business. TIle
duration of the collaboration may be vel)' short and limited to a particular project for a
single customer, or a vel)' long tenn collaborative effort A flexible production network
is not just a joint venture among several finns. 1lle nature of the collaboration tends to
be deeper in a true network, and one fonn of collaborative endeavor tends to lead to
others. This constantly shifting, flexible organization of the production system is typical
of flexible manufacturing networks in Italy and elsewhere.

A recent report by the British Columbia Trade Development Corporation (B.c. Trade)
highlights networks and network formation. This report describes networks as a system
of cooperation among competing finns to marlcet services, particularly in international
marlcets. 1bis report also provides an historical perspective on networks, from its roots
in Emilia-Romagna, a province in central nonheast Italy, and the development of
networks in other locations. The flexible network model has been used in many areas,
and case studies on six network programs are presented in this report In addition, efforts
to establish networks in British Columbia are described. Nine networks are in various
stages of fonnation in British Columbia One of the networks that involve the wood
products industI)' includes a consortium of three British Columbia finns: two equipment
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manufacturers and one design and construction firm. This group of manufacturers
marlcets tum-key sawmills to Russia. Another newly formed network is an association of
45 firms (Western Canadian Wood Machinery and Services Export Association) com­
mitted to jointly serve international marlcets. A directory and profile of the association's
members has been completed. TIle third network is a group of twelve secondary wood
products manufacturers from B.C. working together to penetrate the Japanese market
Both the Japanese marlc.et and the machinery and services export initiatives were devel­
oped in cooperation with the Canadian Forest Servcie

Several programs help spark the creation of networks. As noted earlier, the Key Indus­
tries DevelopmentProgram of the Oregon EDD has helped form 20 networks and
trained 37 network brokers. Another example of a group that helps firms organize into
networks is the Appalachian Centerfor Economic Networks (ACENEf), a private non­
profit corporation that facilitates the flexible manufacturing network formation process
among small manufacturing firms in eleven counties in southeastern Ohio. They work
toward creating and retaining jobs through developing direct links between the economic
development conununity and firms. To date this group has played a key role in design­
ing and carrying out joint projects that support FMN production in four areas: training,
telecommunications, modernization, and access to capital.

TIle Centerfor Economic Development at Eastern Kentucky University has also been
involved in flexible manufacturing network formation. The Center helped create a group
of 15-20 firms in central Kentucky called the Kentucky Wood Manufacturers Network
which produces architectural millwork, hardwood dimension, and furniture.

Technological Assistance

Making the latest technology available to firms so they can improve their production
process and production capacity, fully utilize wood fiber and produce less waste, and
access research on products and production processes is critical to wood product firms.

One example of a technology assistance program is the Centerfor Economic Develop­
ment at Eastern Kentucky University. The Center was set up in 1989 as a resource for
the secondary wood products industry and to assist in the growth and expansion of the
industry. The Center offers technical assistance in the areas of product development,
plant layout, preparation of business plans, and assistance on other technical problems.

Another example that offers technical assistance as pan of a larger program is the Forest
Products Division at Washingion State's Department ofTrade and Economic Develop­
ment (D1ED). Initiated in 1989, this Division manageS a program that promotes value
added manufacturing in Washington and provides technical and marketing assistance,
and conducts feasibility studies for small and medium sized forest produetcompanies.
The division provides technical aid to small and medium-sized mills which must mod­
ernize in order to survive.

Forintek Canada Corporation, in cooperation with private companies and groups of
companies, provides technical training seminars. Forintek encourages technological
implementation of concepts, processes, products and education programs. Forintek also
provides technical assessment reports on emerging manufacturing technologies.

The Tennessee Valley Authority's ([VA) Forest Products program and the Manufactur­
ing Development Program provide technical assistance to firms within a 201 county/
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seven state region. TIle manufacturing development program serves all indusbies
including the forest and wood products industry. The forest products program delivers
technical assistance to the primary and secondary wood products industry through
consulting and ttaining seminars. When appropriate expertise is not available internally,
TVA links the finns with other providers. TVA has technical assistance available in
such areas as indusoial engineering, marketing research, and environmental engineering.
Some specific areas of technical assistance are cost reduction programs for dry kilns.
sawmill improvement programs, and statistical process control programs.

Research

Much of the research underway focuses on product potential. One example of current
research, the agroforestry initiative at Washington State University, explores the ec0­

nomic options of agroforestry management in the Pacific Northwest WSU researchers
are investigating the potential for cultivation of agricultural and alternative forest prod­
ucts such as floral greens, wild mushrooms, drought and disease tolerance native plants
for landscaping, naturally occurring medicinal plants, and Western Washington's native
ginseng, Devils Cub. This research, conducted for the Columbia-Pacific Resource
Conservation and Development COlmci1 concluded that agroforestry holds great promise
for a broad-based economic development effon in southwest Washington.

1lle University ofIdaho has produced a directory of Idaho's wood products manufactur­
ers, and other infonnation on Idaho's forest products industry. Research effons have
included identifying new marlcets for wood products, conducting business feasibility
studies, and carrying out mill.studies that look to adding value to the processing of
primary wood products.

The Centerfor International Trade in Forest Products (CINTRAFOR) at the University
of Washington addresses opportunities and problems related to the international trade of
wood and fiber products. The Center emphasizes forest economics and policy analysis,
trade and environment, technology development, marketing, and value-added wood
products. CINIRAFOR's research program is a comprehensive and integrated set of
studies addressing key problems and opportunities inherent in the international trade of
forest products. To meet the needs of overseas and domestic buyers in identifying
producers of specific wood products, CINTRAFOR recently published a directory of
value added wood products manufacturers in Washington state. This will serve as a
buyers guide to manufacturers and suppliers of Washington State-made value added
wood products.

Extensive silvicultural research is also underway. High quality wood can be achieved
through silvicultural techniques. The U.S. Forest Service Pacific Northwest Research
Station has been conducting research and has produced several publications on pruning,
including users guides for pruning Douglas Fir and Ponderosa Pine. Silvicultural
research at the University of Washington has been related to the potential for production
of higher valued wood, as well as new forest management jobs, and greater biological
diversity through pruning and thinning.

Capital Formation

Some programs extend grants and loans to enterprises as part of the services they offer.
Some of the federally funded programs such as the Appalachian Regional Commission,

21



Lessons Leamed

and the National Timber Bridge Initiative offer grants for specific projects on a competi­
tive basis. Others offer loans to communities or groups of finns. One example is the
Linn-Benton Regional Strategy in Oregon. Administered by Oregon Economic Develop­
ment Department through its Regional Strategies Unit. the Strategy provides business
and tectmical assistance, financial support. and a business incubator facility for new and
existing businesses that create a new crop, product. process or service. This a two­
county pannership worldng to help businesses plan for the future by encouraging the
implementation of new ideas and technology. High technology, agriculture, and forestry
are the key industries selected for emphasis. Program managers hope that the use of new
ideas and technology will diversify local industIy and add value through new processing
opportunities. Examples of the services offered are:

• The Businesses Service Fund helps local businesses, farmers, and foresters obtain
professional services which support new ideas and technology.

• The Applied Research Fund links local businesses with research facilities to
conduct applied research projects with commercial application.

• The Investment Incentives Fund helps local small businesses attract capital to
adopt new technology. Grant money is provided for business start-up. There is a
job creation requirement of one job for every $lO,CXX> grant. All funds must be
matched by private industry.

• The Business Enterprise Center provides assembly and office space to young
companies.

• The Advanced Science and Technology Institute at OSU provides tectmical
assistance and support for applied research.

• A Technology Outreach Agent promotes new ideas in agriculture, forestry, and
high technology to businesses in Linn and Benton counties.

• The Public Works Department of Washington State's Department of Community
Development offers loans to communities in designated timber-impacted areas
for new or expanded infrastructure projects that support industry or tourism.
They coordinate their efforts with the Timber Community Economic Revitaliza­
tion Board. This program provides for increased, diversified economic opportu­
nities for residents of timber dependent areas of Washington State.

• The Forest Products Division of Washington State's Department ofTrade and
Economic Development has introduced a new Revolving Loan Fund Program
designed to finance projects that introduce and implement value added produc­
tion processes. Funding for this initiative came from the US Forest Service and
allows the program to build on existing projects. This assistance is available to
eligible and qualified forest products finns in the state of Washington. The
program hopes to attract small and medium sized forest product manufacturing
firms that are interested in creating a project that will contribute.to the diversifica­
tion of the forest products industry.

Several program managers interviewed for Making Wood Work outlined lessons they
learned as they progressed through the program design and implementation process.
Many themes recur. Government's commitment to value added strategies must be
ongoing, and must include time and technical expertise as well as financial resources.
Government must develop clear measurable objectives, evaluate programs in progress,
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and retain the flexibility to modify them where warranted. It must forge working
relationships with industry leaders and enterprise managers to make certain that services
meet the sector's needs.

Get the Commitment of Public Leaders

'The support and cornminnent from government must go beyond funding and include
long-term investment of time and expertise. TIle strength ofcomminnent can bring
about increased participation from both other agencies of government and from industry,
can speed program start-up. and can facilitate greater collaboration. For instance. the
Northeast Forestry Alliance (NEFA) has seen its impact grow as the longer-term com­
mittnent is demonstrated. Often such support is even more likely to materialize if a high
level official commissions or sponsors a group. as has been found with Washington's
Governor's Council on Forestry.

Coordinate and Collaborate

Effective value added initiatives found coordination with other service providers to be
essential. Collaboration can avoid wasteful duplication and help fill service gaps.
Effective program managers are intent upon building partnerships, coordinating pro­
grams. improving communication and cooperation among and between programs. and
exchanging information. Such exchanges can improve existing programs by helping
them to learn from demonstration projects and other models. Regional organizations
have found success in forming working groups comprised of representatives from several
states, because it encourages joint problem solving.

Building public-private pannerships helps insure that value added programs meet the
needs of the industry they are attempting to serve. and involves the industry in program
design and implementation. According to the Evergreen Partnership. success is the
combined effort of industry. government and academia working together to bring about
market understanding. to share information and processes. and locate potential buyers for
the sale ofvalue-added products. The Evergreen Partnership is a focal point for market­
ing information and activity and is a central source for potential customers to make
inquiries concerning resources. services. and markets.

The Regional Strategies Program in Oregon is based upon the understanding that each
region has its own approach to solving economic problems and promoting economic
development. However. the most successful strategies are those whose participants lead
the region in partnership with the state and with other entities. Coordinating regional
efforts. maximizing resources. and increasing private industry involvement are critical.

The Wisconsin Department ofNatural Resources Forest Products Unit has worlced with
Forward Wisconsin on such projects as business development and representation of
Wisconsin companies at trade shows and exhibitions. For the past ten years. the Forest
Products Unit has worlced with industry to establish foreign marlcets for Wisconsin. The
emphasis is on exporting value added forest products such as hardwood dimension,
veneer. and flooring.

Promoting cooperation and communication within the industry helps firms identify
common problems and opportunities that companies can address together. The Oregon
Wood Products Competitiveness Corporation has found that direct contact with the
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industry through the fonnation of regional chapters is very effective in program develop­
ment Bringing the industry together, and involving its members in creating programs
has helped to increase OWPCC's impact on a fragmented industry.

Target Sectors and Services

Targeting specific sectors and services enables programs to develop the expertise needed
to help wood products firms improve their competitiveness.

The New Mexico Wood Products Association has organized the small, specialized wood
products manufacturers in the state and provides assistance in making them more
competitive. The association was fonned by the industry and industry observers inde­
pendent of state efforts. The organization has targeted assistance in marlceting as the area
which it will develop special expertise. The catalog they assembled, New Mexico Home
Catalog, features wood products manufacturing firms that produce a variety of house­
hold furnishings including furniture and other wood products. Firms pay a fee to adver­
tise and have photos of their wares featured in this catalog.

In the east. the Appalachian Export Centerfor Hardwoods (APEX) has also designed a
program that targets the exporting potential of companies. This program was created
through the efforts of West Virginia University's College of Agriculture & Forestry and
the federal government. It emphasizes the importance of manufacturing goods out of the
region's abundant natural resources rather than exporting those resources along with
jobs, income, and profit.

The Moorehead State University technology transfer and technical assistance program
found that emphasizing the existing industry has the greatest potential to produce positive
results. They also recognize the importance ofmaintaining a training program, and
coordinating with other training programs to eliminate duplication and join forces on
training activities.

Catawba Valley Community College, in Hickory, North Carolina is an example of a
training and education program targeted to the local needs of the wood products industry.
It was established over 30 years ago with a combination of public and private funds. One
of the strong points of this program is the level of coordination that has taken place
between many public and private organizations. The college provides training for
students wishing to enter into the field of wood products manufacturing, and thereby
assures well educated and well trained employees to the industry. Apprenticeship
models are heavily utilized.

The Wood Products Extension Group at North Carolina State University has found that
by working directly with the industry through their technical assistance program, they
have brought their expertise to the industry, achieved additional familiarity of the subject,
and gained knowledge of the industry. This group is in a unique position of having
credibility with the industry, and also having a strong link so they can identify the
industry's needs. While rural development is an abstract concept, this extension work is
much more tangible: when firms become a stronger force and grow, more and better
paying jobs follow, creating wealth and income in the community.
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Organize Regionally

Organizing programs on a regional (or multi-state) basis can enable them to (X>01 efforts
and resources. Designing programs that reach across political boundaries to share
expertise and knowledge of the industry streamlines problem solving and delivery of
services, thus generating gains in efficiency in program efforts and results. The North­
west Forestry Alliance is one such regional program. As described earlier, NEFA
resulted from the efforts and insight of the state foresters in the four states who recog­
nized that they could do more as a group to address common forest and wood product
opportunities.

The Massachusetts Department ofEnvironmental Management has learned that the
greatest benefit of regional initiatives is to get together with others that are dealing with
some of the same issues, and identifying ways to tackle problems collectively. Regional
efforts also enable easy incorporation of the private sector into the process. Placing a
greater emphasis on including private industry in the process has become a priority.

Be Flexible

Making programs flexible, so they can adapt to changes in the wood products industry is
also an important feature of value added wood products initiatives. Keeping the door
open to new opportunities and listening to and learning from the industry keeps programs
fresh and responsive to industry needs.

Assessing programs and their effectiveness allows for better design and focus of projects.
Evaluations can help to assess if programs are reaching their goals. The Appalachian
Export Center for Hardwoods (APEX) has learned the importance of follow-up commu­
nication with the firms it works with. Program managers have found that interviews
regarding program impact can generate a great deal of valuable information, including
individual company successes. 'This requires a constant and consistent effort to stay on
top of current research, current market trends, current changes in the industry, and pass
this valuable information and research results to the industry in a timely fashion.

Evaluations can help programs increase their strengths and reduce their weaknesses. In
one such assessment, Oregon Marketplace found that only a portion of the potential
market was being served. The evaluation identified the best clients as small owner­
managed businesses with limited resources for marketing. Program adjustments were
made accordingly.

Adjustments must be made and flexibility developed even when programs become very
successful. North Carolina State University (NCSU) has received so many requests for
assistance that they now divide their time between outside requests (nationally and
internationally), and their in-state extension worK. The program is seeking to reach more
firms than would otherwise be possible by working with firms collectively through
seminars and group meetings.
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Appendix I-East Coast

Appalachian Export Center For Hardwoods (APEX),
West Virginia

Contact: W. Ramsay Smith, Ph.D.
Address: P.O. Box (:J)61

Morgantown, VN 26506-6061
Phone: (304) 293-7577
Fax: (304)29~7579

The Appalachian Export Center For Hardwoods (APEX) was fonned in 1989 to empha­
size the importance of manufacturing goods rather than exporting resources, jobs,
income, and profit APEX seeks to increase the export ofvalue added hardwood prod­
ucts from the Appalachian region. It works closely with the Colleges of Agriculture,
Forestry, Business & Economics, and the Cooperative Extension System at West
Virginia University. APEX links producers of timber and forest products in the Appala­
chian region (which includes the states ofAlabama, Georgia, Kentucky, Maryland, New
York. North Carolina, Ohio, Pennsylvania, South Carolina, Termessee, Virginia, and
West Virginia) with the international trade community.

APEX has developed programs in research and education. APEX's research involves
gathering and analyzing infonnation to improve the competitiveness of wood products.
The education program targets students and promotes understanding of international
issues, business practices, and resources. APEX also publishes a newsletter, a statistical
quarterly, and holds workshop series. APEX works hard to meet the needs of a diverse
industry composed of finns with different levels of expertise and tailors its services to
meet these differing needs accordingly.

APEX is a collaborative effort between the public and private sectors and coordinates
efforts with other private and public organizations. It coordinated a trade mission for
dimension manufacturers to the UK, Belgium, and Gennany, and has outreach programs
including APEX's publications, statistical quarterly, and research reports.

Appalachian Regional Commission,
Washington D.C.

Contact: Neil Walp or salim Kublawi
Address: 1666 Connecticut Ave. N.W.

Washington, D.C. 20235
Phone: (202) 67~7845

The Appalachian Regional Commission (ARC) is a federal program composed of the13
states of Alabama, Georgia, Kentucky, Maryland, Mississippi, New York, North Caro­
lina, Ohio, Pennsylvania, South Carolina, Tennessee, Virginia, and West Virginia.
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Congress appropriates about $197 million in funds to ARC which it allocates to two
programs, a highway program and a community development program. The highway
program receives the majority of the funding. The community development program
includes initiatives which emphasize the wood products industry. These range from
research and conferences to funding projects for a variety of projects including technical
assistance. research, training, export marketing, and demonstration projects. About $26
million of the funds are allocated through a specific formula to the individual states for
this program and are matched by each state. Funding for specific programs, however, is
the decision of each state. Requests for funding for individual projects are submitted to
the Governor's office and the Appalachian Development Office in the respective states.
Occasionally, ARC issues RFP's for specific initiatives. such as tourism. However,
projects and programs are more often funded through the Governors' offices. A major
portion of the funds provide infrastructure, health services. and education. However,
some individual state projects related to the wood products industry have involved issues
such as capital constraints, technology transfer, and accessing export markets for small
producers.

ARC has an indirect relationship with the wood products sector. Since ARC is a feder­
ally funded commission that works directly with the Governors' offices in 13 states, there
is greater coordination with other public agencies than with the private sector. ARC
recognizes the need for greater coordination with individual wood products related
projects.

ARC organized a manufacturing competitiveness conference in November 1992 in
Baltimore. The conference resulted in ARC considering ways to access private sector
involvement, and identifying major clusters of industries to target.

Catawba Valley Community College,
Furniture Production Management Program,
Furniture Design &Development Program,
North Carolina

Contact: Ken Eckard
Address: 2550 Hvvy 70 E.

Hickory, NC 28602
Phone: (704) 327-7000

The Furniture Production Management Program and the Furniture Design and Develop­
ment Program were established over 30 years ago with a combination of public and
private funds at the Catawba Valley Community College to assist the secondary wood
products industry. Currently, funding comes from the state, furniture manufacturers, and
some county contributions. Training furniture manufacturing employees has been
identified as necessary through every phase of the production process. Industry input is
included in the design of the education and training program through an advisory
committee composed of furniture industry manufacturers.

11lispannership between industry and education has resulted in an apprenticeship-type
educational program where the students receive practical and applied experience through
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working for finns while taking classes. TIlis program also offers on-site training at larger
finns. To meet the needs of smaller finns, the program offers Fixed Industry Training, a
state funded program that conducts training at the finn and night classes on campus.

One of the strong points of the educational program is the level ofcoordination between
many public and private organizations. TIle initial coordination between public and
private entities which started this program continues between the school and different
levels of government.

center for Economic Development,
Keniucky

Contact: Dr. Albert Spencer
Address: Fitzpatrick 307

Eastern Kentucky University
Richmond, KY 40475

Phone: «(:£:I:) 622-2334
Fax: «(:£:I:) 622-6274

The Center for Economic Development, a combined effort of Eastern Kentucky Univer­
sity and the Economic Development Administration, was created in 1989 to emphasize
the development of the secondary wood products industry in Kentucky. It is a resource
for the secondary wood products industry and offers teclmica1 assistance in the areas of
product development, plant layout, preparation ofbusiness plans, and other teclmical
problems as well as producing a directory of manufacturers. TIle Center for Economic
Development has also been involved in flexible manufacturing networlc fonnatloll TIle
Kentucky Wood Manufacturers Networlc, composed of 15 to 20 firms in central Ken­
tucky, produces architectural millworte. hardwood dimension, and furniture. TIle second­
ary manufacturing industry is mostly made up ofsmall finns and is less developed than
the primary industry in the state. Since almost 70 percent of Kentucky's wood resources
leave the state as logs or green lumber, the center recently began exploring strategies to
develop the secondary manufacturing industry, utilize nearby resources, produce prod­
ucts from those resources, and increase employment.

The center maintains a close relationship with wood products finns and organizations
such as the state cabinet for economic development, regional economic development
centers, and community organizations.



Coalition of Northeastern Governors (CONEG)
Policy Research center,
Northeast Regional Biomass Energy Program,
Washington D.C.

Contact: Phil Lusk
Address: 400 N. Capitol St. Suite 382

Washington, D.C. 2(0)1
Phone: (202) 624-8450
Fax: (202) 624-8463

The Coalition ofNortheastern Governors (CONEG) Regional Biomass Energy Program,
a combined federaVstate program fonned through a grant from the Biomass Energy
Technology Division of the U.S. Department of Energy in 1983, encourages regionally­
specific biofuel energy projects. The program maintains close relationships with the
private sector, government, regional and national organizations, industry and trade
organizations, and universities. An ongoing effort exists to provide technical assistance
to and cosponsor projects with state energy, forestry, and environmental offices to
strengthen and integrate programs.

The lr1and Group,
Maine

Contact: Uoyd Irland
Address: 7 North Chestnut Street

Augusta, ME 04330
Phone: (207) 622-4023
Fax: (207) 622-9739

The lrland Group is a private finn that offers consulting services and analysis of costs,
wood products marketing, program evaluation, training, and timber supply.

The Irland Group offers a wide variety of consulting selVices. It conducts cost analysis,
investment analysis. and other evaluation projections on timber supply. In addition, it
provides market opportunities and mill and product feasibility studies in the wood
products sector. Other policy instruments ofThe Irland Group include program and
policy evaluation, economic development studies, and economic impact analysis. The
finn also provides training on industry conditions and trends, and marketing techniques
and skills. The group provides these services nationally, as well as in various provinces
in Canada.

In The Irland Group's article, "State Roles in Economic Development: The Case of
Forest-Based Development in Maine," and "Value Added in the Maine Economy"
summary and technical reports. several other programs are cited as being involved with
value added strategies. These include the following:

• The Eastern Maine Development Corporation - a multi-county organization.
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• Maine World Trade Association - an organization partially funded by the state
which serves business needs in the area to promote trade through putting on
workshops, seminars. and overseas trade shows. (This organization is described
separately).

• Maine Capital Corporation - created in 1981, a non-profit venture fund based in
Portland designed to provide risk capital to Maine finns. 1bis finn has grown
and has created a new vehicle, the North Atlantic Capital Corporation to serve
Northern New England needs.

• Community Development Block Grant Program - a program administered by the
Maine Depamnent of Economic and Community Development with federal
funding. It funds local public works and housing projects, as well as loan to
businesses that are administered through local communities or counties.

• The Maine Science and Tectmology commission - one of the clients of The
Irland Group which has supported a number of specialized centers in efforts to
bring technology more swiftly into application in a number of sectors.

• Maine Development Foundation - involved in various studies.

Maine World Trade Association,
Maine

Contact: Thomas H. Eyman
Address: 77 Sewall Street

Augusta, ME 04330
Phone: (207) 622-D234
Fax: (207) 622-3760

The Maine World Trade Association (MWTA) is a private, non-profit organization
dedicated to providing quality technical and educational services to Maine businesses
seeking to compete worldwide. 1bis organization is funded both publicly, from the state
of Maine, and from private-sector based resources. Membership for the Maine World
Trade Association (MWTA) includes finns of all sizes from all pans of Maine. The
State of Maine takes a private-sector approach to the delivery of international trade
development services to Maine companies by providing funding to the Maine World
Trade Association (MWTA).

The scope of this organizations international activity and expertise is wide ranging,
covering exporting, importing, joint ventures, and licensing agreements. In February of
1993, the MWfA held a workshop on wood product exporting. In addition, the Maine
World Trade Association publishes a World Trade Wise newsletter and an International
Commerce Training Guide.
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Massachusetts Department of Environmental Management,
Massachusetts

Contact: Charles Thompson
Address: 100 Combridge St., 19th Roor

Boston. MA 02202
Phone: (617) 727-3188

The Massachusetts Department of Envirorunental Management Division of Forests and
Parks currently has a cogeneration study and a timber bridge program in progress. 11le
cogeneration study explores the feasibility of producing energy from wood fiber and
determines whether a market exists. The timber bridge program, part of the larger fed­
eral program, explores the use ofnative materials in the construction of timber bridges.

The University ofMassachusetts aiso wodes with the wood products industry through its
Cooperative Extension Service. It holds wodeshops and provides teclmical assistance for
the wood products industry. Although the secondary wood products industry is well
developed in the state, teclmical assistance in the past has been mostly directed toward
the primary wood products industry.

Morehead State University,
Office of Wood Technology,
Kentucky

Contact: Robert Bouer
Address: UPO Box 721

Morehead. KY 40351
Phone: (CiY:J) 783-2627
Fax: (CiY:J) 783-2678

Morehead State University Office of Wood Technology has developed a technology
transfer project for the wood products industry. An emphasis to develop the secondary
wood products industry was only a portion of the original proposal. Over time, the
emphasis of the project has changed to focus more on the secondary wood products
manufacturing industry, especially since many of the larger primary wood products
manufacturers were moving into remanufacturing and secondary manufacturing. The
Office of Wood Technology emphasizes expanding existing firms rather than recruiting
or starting new firms since most of the growth has occurred in the existing industry.
Economic development organizations, such as the East Kentucky Corporation, focus on
bringing in secondary manufacturers as a strategy to expand the industry. The Office of
Wood Technology also acts as a clearinghouse of information by helping the industry
make contacts, publishing a newsletter, producing a marketing brochure, and coordinat­
ing and organizing training sessions with the Kentucky Forest Industries Association.

The Office of Wood Technology provides technical assistance to the forest products
industry in matters relating to problem solving, marlceting, financing, equipment selec­
tion, resource availability, and wood industry development. It also coordinates efforts at
all levels of goverrunent.
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New England Forest Consortium,
Rhode Island

Contact: Ellen Grady
Address: P.O. Box 7t:IJ

Chepacht, RI 02814
Phone: 1-800-772-8733
Fax: (203) 455-9107

The New England Forest Consortium is a non-profit organization with both private and
public sector representation on its Boanl of Directors which works cooperatively with
Connecticut, Massachusetts, and Rhode Island to promote natural resource issues that
reduce forest fragmentation. This organization also participates in the Forest Stewanl­
ship Program, which is part of the Department ofAgriculture and provides fimding for
trail development. About 10 percent of the consortium's time is directed towanl the
forest products industry and 90 percent is direCted towanl public relations to preserve and
manage forest lands.

North carolina State University,
College of Forestry,
Wood Products Extension Group,
North Carolina

Contact: Joe Denig
Steve Hanover

Address: Box 8003 .
Raleigh, NC 27695

Phone: (919) 515-5582
(919) 515-5580

The Wood Products Extension Group, a university-based program at North Carolina
State University College ofForestry, is committed to working with the primary and
secondary wood products industries. The program's main objective is to maintain and
improve the secondary/value added wood products industry since the wood products
industry in North Carolina is mostly furniture.

It publishes research reports, participates in extension work. with firms, identifies needs
within the industry, and creates seminars to meet these needs. It also provides technical
assistance to individual firms. .
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Northeastern Forest Alliance (NEFA),
New York

Contact: Jim Burtis
Address: P.O. Box 932

Soranac Lake, NY 12983
Phone: (518) 327-6332
Fax: (518) 327-3030

1be Northeastern Forest Alliance (NEFA) is a non-profit organization which promotes
the Northeast forest and its related products on a regional basis to national and interna­
tional marlcets. TIle regional pact represents an innovative attempt to create an awareness
of the Northeast forest's resources and malicet them by expanding export opportunities.
NEFA focuses attention on natural resource issues and opportunities that transcend
political boundaries, supports a regional approach to forest planning, and shares technical
expertise in order to streamline problem solving and delivery services.

Marlceting strategies NEFA uses include: Ongoing outreach to raise the public's aware­
ness of forestry related issues; participation in local economic development forums;
wood marlceting; product development; a regional economic development campaign; and
developing strategic alliances with economic development agencies and forest resource
agencies.

NEFA is the result of efforts from the state foresters from each of the four states worlcing
together to form this organization. Each state has one forester who is part of the '"Tech
Team" and provides staff for NEFA. Although the emphasis ofNEFA is in the area of
utilization and marlceting, the foresters that make up the Tech-Team are from areas such
as forest management, forest resource planning, and forest product utilization. TIle Tech­
Team members do not worlc full time for NEFA, but integrate NEFA responsibilities into
their full time positions with the state. While the projects and agenda for NEFA are
determined with input from all members, the final decision is made by the '"Tech Team."

NEFA represents the four state region in domestic and international trade shows, taking
trade leads back to the industry. NEFA exhibits what it calls a "trade show kit," which
consists of samples of wood and products, and display brochures. It is currently worlcing
on a diskette directory of primary and secondary wood products manufacturers to take to
trade shows. NEFA also coordinates efforts with the Northeastern Wood Products
Exhibition where it has conducted seminars.

NEFA maintains a close relationship between the ''Tech-Team'' and private sector.
NEFA has also worlced with the Northern Forest Lands Council, and the American
Hardwood Export Council. Through ongoing communication and participation in local
forums, NEFA has brought togethef"a wide variety of interests and organized groups.
NEFA worlcs directly with state agencies within its region, as well as other federal
agencies and other regional entities. For example, NEFA and CONEG (Coalition of
Northeastern Governors) co-sponsored a wood pellet conference in June 1993.

NEFA represents an innovative attempt to create awareness of the Northeast's forest
resources and to market it by expanding export opportunities. It also seeks to focus
attention on natural resource issues and opportunities that transcend political boundaries,
supports a regional approach to forest planning, and shares technical expertise such as is
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described in 'Success Stories' in Wood-Products Manufacturing and Forest-Resource­
Based Economic Development, 1989.

Pennsylvania Hardwood Development Council,
Pennsylvania

Contact: Ronald C. Anderson
Address: 408 Forum &.Jilding

Harrisburg, PA 17120
Phone: a17) 772-3715
Fax: a17) 234-4560

The Pennsylvania Hardwood Development Council was created through legislation
passed by the General Assembly in 1988. This legislation called for a 2l-member
council to develop, expand, and promote the hardwood industry in the Commonwealth.
TIle council meets on a quarterly basis to review ongoing activities, makes recommenda­
tions on issues affecting the hardwood industry, and works with both private indusuy and
all levels of government to achieve these goals.

The council provides a comprehensive needs assessment to develop a long-term strategy
for the Hardwood Initiative which was formed into a 56-page document with numerous
findings and recommendations. In addition, the council has developed and implemented
an aggressive marketing campaign to promote Pennsylvania hardwood and the Com­
monwealth as a good place to expand or locate a forest products business. The primary
objective of this marketing effort is to encourage the expansion ofexisting Pennsylvania
firms. The council also believes a strong continuing education program is needed by
small and medium-sized hardwood companies in the state. A $200,000 grant from the
Appalachian Regional Commission (ARC) is being utilized to develop a number of
educational efforts.

The council has also formed six multicounty hardwood utilization groups to help orga­
nize and promote the industry on a regional basis. The regional groups are involved with
a number of activities including technical assistance, resource stewaniships, workshops,
and seminars. In addition, the Northeast Wood Products Exposition was.held for the first
time in Pennsylvania in 1989. The Hardwood Development Council has contributed
funds for the past two years to help promote the show. The council has provided joint
funding with the Pennsylvania Department ofTransportation for a timber bridge project
that deals with the refinement of design stress values for hardwood.

In its first year, the council funded research projects dealing with the utilization of low­
quality logs, wood adhesives, market trends for hardwood products, and a location
analysis. Current projects include an analysis of environmental regulations, a job
analysis, timber bridge research, and logger training. The council has strongly supported
the timber bridge initiative which is being coordinated by the Pennsylvania Department
ofTransportation, which will construct 17 timber bridges in the Commonwealth during
the next two years. A total of $37,5000 has been earmarked from the Hardwood Initia­
tive for timber bridge research. Furthermore, the Hardwood Initiative has provided
financial and other support to the six regional hardwood utilization groups that have
formed in Pennsylvania These groups have pursued a grassroots approach to organizing
the industry, and have fonned the statewide Pennsylvania Wood Industry Association.
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Tennessee Valley Authority (TVA),
Renewable Natural Resource Extension Program,
Manufacturing Development Program,
Forest Products Development Program
Tennessee

Contact: Mike Stitt and Bridgette Ellis
Address: 2617 W. Andrew Jackson Hwy.

Westgate Professional Building
Morristown, TN 37814

Phone: (615) 632-1512
(615) 587-5600

Fax: (615) 632-1612

'The Tennessee Valley Authority (IVA) forest programs work to develop markets for
timber and recruit forest product industries to the Termessee Valley. The Manufacturing
Development Program at TVA has been in existence for about ten years, and serves all
industries including the forest/wood products industry. This program works within a 201
countyn state region. Targeted finns are small to mediwn sized manufacturing finns.
The Manufacturing Development Program provides technical assistance in such areas as
industrial engineering, marketing research, and environmental engineering.

The Forest Products program delivers technical assistance to the primary and secondary
wood products industry through consulting and training seminars. Some of the specific
areas of technical assistance are cost reduction programs for dry kilns, sawmill improve­
ment programs, and statistical process connol programs. 'The Forest Products Program's
goal is to provide infonnation to the industry so they can operate more efficiently and
maintain or expand their operations. The needs of the industry are identified through site
visits to the mills. Issues identified as pressing by the industry are new markets, and
waste utilization. TVA has worked with state agencies to produce an industry directory.
TVA conducts workshops and training seminars and encourages mills to host more
industry visits to their plants. Goals of this program include creating 1,000 jobs per year
and reducing residual waste. To meet this second goal, TVA is looking at new and alter­
native uses of residues, and is conducting a feasibility study on residual wastes in a stearn
plant

Both the Manufacturing Development Program and the Forest Products Development
Program administrated by TVA maintain a close relationship with private industry
through outreach and technical assistance. The Manufacturing Development Program
works with local chambers of commerce, development organizations, and city and
county officials as a means of identifying needs of the various industries this program
works with. The Forest Products Program also works cooperatively with other agencies
and groups, such as forestry associations. Both programs coordinate efforts with the
University ofTennessee, Auburn University. and Mississippi State.
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U.S. Department of Agriculture,
Renewable Natural Resource Extension Program,
Washington D.C.

Contact: Donald E. Nelson
Address: 3865 S. Building

Washington, D.C. 20250-0900
Phone: (202) 720-5004
Fax: (202) 690-4869

1be Renewable Natural Resource Extension Program. created through federal legislation
and administered through the Cooperative Extension System. teaches how research
results can be applied to the management of renewable natural resources. 1be USDA
Cooperative Extension System is a federal -state -county partnership composed of the
USDA Extension SeIVice. state land-grant universities, and local governments. TIle
Extension SeIVice is an agency of the United States Department of Agriculture (USDA).
Examples of the wide variety of topics covered in this program are biodiversity, best
management practices, sustainable production, resource economics. and wetlands. 1be
audience for this educational program are the owners. managers. and users of renewable
natural resources.

1be Extension SeIVice directs its programs primarily to owners and users ofprivate
lands. It coordinates efforts with other groups interested in managing renewable natural
resources such as state and federal conseIVation agencies. state and county development
agencies. state departments ofcommerce. commodity organizations. forest and wood
products industries. and various associations and business organizations. In addition. the
Extension SeIVice provides educational programs on the renewable natural resources
challenges facing the world to landowners. resource-based induStries, communities. and
the public.

Program examples are listed in Renewable Natural Resources Education, Taking Care of
our Forests and Rangelands, (August 1992) including the development of a computer­
ized hardwood veneer quality control program in North Carolina, environmental educa­
tion through public broadcasting in Maine, and continuing education programs in
Minnesota, New Hampshire. and New York. Renewable Natural Resources Education,
Improving the Environment and the Productivity ofForests and Rangelands Through
Extension Education, A report to Congress on the 1991-1995 Renewable Resources
Extension Program, list each states successes for the past five years.
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U.S. Department of Agriculture,
National Timber Bridge Initiative,
West Virginia

Contact: National Timber Bridge
Information Resource Center
Northeastern /Vea
state and Private Forestry
USDA Forest 5eNice
180 Canfield st.
Morgantown, VN 26505

Phone: (304) 291-1591

'The National Tunber Bridge Initiative, federally initiated by U.S. Congress in 1989, was
developed in response to a need to repair or replace deteriorating highway bridges, and
an opportunity to improve and revitalize ruraI economies. Many of these deteriorating
bridges are on double lane, ruraI roads, and are suited for wood construction now that
technological advances have taken timber bridge construction to a new level.

Advances in timber bridge design, treatment, and the preservation of wood have contritr
uted to this initiative and opportunity. 'The initiative diversifies local economies by
improving ruraI transportation networlcs, expanding the range ofmarlcets for wood

. products, and creating service industries for wood bridge construction.

The National TImber Bridge Initiative has targeted its efforts in four areas. 1) Demon­
stration timber bridges. Over 200 bridges have been constructed of wood and have
proven to be a cost effective alternative to bridges constructed out of concrete and steel.
2) Research. Most of the research takes place at the Forest Products Lab in Madison,
Wisconsin. This research includes design criteria, sources of hardwood structural
lumber, construction methodologies, and monitoring the perfonnance of demonstration
projects. 3) Technology Transfer and Information Management. The Tunber Bridge
Infonnation Resource Center provides access to information on emerging technologies,
and other reports and publications. It also provides coordination of conferences, worlc­
shops, and seminars. 4) Rural Revitalization. Economic diversity and community
stability is enhanced through emphasizing under-utilized wood in a new product, creating
local jobs and long-tenn employment prospects, and creating additional service indus­
tries.

U.S. Department of Agriculture,
Rural Development through Forestry Program
Pennsylvania

Contact: Michael T. Rains
Address: 5 Radnor Corporate Center

100 Matsonford Road, Suite 200
Radnor, PA 19087-4585

Phone: (215) 975-4103
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In 1989, the USDA Forest Service, Northeastern Area State, and Private Forestry
developed the Rural Development through Forestty Program to focus its role in rural
development and economic diversification assistance. This program, fonned through
legislation. focuses on improving the quality of life in rural America by emphasizing
forest resources. It operates in 20 nonheastem and midwest states and is currently
involved in demonstration projects in Missouri, Vennont, and West Virginia. It also has
special emphasis projects in Delaware, lllinois, Indiana, Iowa, Maine, Massachusetts,
Michigan. Minnesota, New Hampshire, New Jersey, Ohio, Pennsylvania, Wisconsin, and
with regional groups such as the Northeastern Forest Alliance (NEFA), and Northeast
Utilization and Marketing Council (NEUMC). The Rural Development Council through
Forestry Program is involved in many projects in these states, providing assessments and
analyzing infonnation.

The results of these projects are summarized in the recent publication, Rural Develop­
ment through Forestry in the Northeast and Midwest, Status Report, Fiscal Year 1992.

Virginia Center for Innovative Technology,
Technology Transfer & Assistance Program,
Virginia

Contact: Harry Groot
Address: Wytheville Community College

1(XX) E. Main St.
Wytheville, VA 24382

Phone: (703) 228-5541
Fax: (703)228~

The Teclmology Transfer and Assistance Program, a non-profit program initially funded
by the Appalachian Regional Commission, identifies the needs of the wood products
industry through conducting seminars to transfer teclmology to the industry providing
technical assistance.

An assessment survey indicated that kiln capacity was identified as a need by secondary
manufacturers, and as a value added opportunity by primary manufacturers. Seminars to
transfer teclmology to the wood products industry were not received with enthusiasm,
however, and working with individual finns to transfer teclmology was received posi­
tively by the industry. Subsequent to the grant, both the extension work with individual
finns and strides to link the opportunity and the need for kiln capacity have continued. A
business plan was developed to fonn a network of ten primary manufacturers into a
limited corporation. The networks goal is to purchase and operate a dry kiln facility, and
provide dry lumber to local and export markets. The highest grade dry lumber would go
to the export markets, and the rest of the material would go to local secondary manufac­
turers. The Technology Transfer & Assistance Program is currently looking for a site
that will be about 200 acres to not only provide space for the dry kiln facility, but
eventually house other networks and businesses that will add other value added steps.
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Appendix II-Midwest

ACENET (Appalachian center for Economic Networks),
Ohio

Contact: June Holley, Co-Director
Address: 94 N. Columbus Rd.

Athens, OH, 45701
Phone (614) 592-3854
Fax: (614) 593-5451

1he Appalachian Center for Economic NetwoIks (ACENET), a non-profit organization.
perfonns research and activities designed to provide greater undermanding and support of
flexible manufacturing networks as an economic development strategy. It strives to
create and retainjobs through the establishment of market-driven flexible manufacturing
networks, defined as groups of small manufacturers that come together to produce items
for custom or niche markets that none of them could manufacture themselves. This
organization's model is an adaptation of economic structures that have led to significant
economic growth in northern Italy.

ACENET develops direct links between the economic development community and
organizations, small business centers, educational institutions, banks,loan funds, technol­
ogy transfer agencies, government entities, and finns. To date, the local economic
development infrastructure has played a key role in designing and canying out joint
projects that support FMN production in four areas: training; telecommunications;
modernization; and access to capital.

ACENET has been successful in getting over 70 small manufacturers to participate in
producing new, high-value and market-accessible housing components for people with
disabilities and the elderly. Four products have been developed to serve this market: an
accessible kitchen unit which includes adjustable cabinets and countertops and sinks; a
wall-mounted, adjustable desk; a free-standing, Shaker-style adjustable desk; and a
gardening tool with a handle designed for ease of use by people with limited grip or hand
strength. ACENET also is currently worlcing on the development of two additional niche
market FMNs: one will focus on specialty food production; and one will deal with
resource reuse and remanufacturing.
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Council of Great Lake Govemors,
Illinois

Contact: Fred Kuzel
Address: 35 East Wacker, Suite 1850

Chicago, IL 60601
Phone: (312) 407-0177
Fax: (312) 407-0038

Initiated in 1983 and composed of the eight mid-western states of illinois, Indiana, Ohio,
Michigan, Minnesota, Permsylvania, New York, and Wisconsin, the Council of Great
Lake Governors, targets the general wood products industry. 1be goal of the Governor's
Great Lakes Biomass Program has been to promote more uses of wood and wood waste
for energy. It provides funds for demonstration projects and provides general infonna­
tion to the public. It also offers a series of workshops on using waste wood for energy
and woOd combustion for energy.

The Great Lakes Governor's program works with wood manufacturing industries and
with the state's energy offices. It assembles an assessment and directory of those who
use wood waste, what they do with it, and how they use it The Biomass Program is
funded through the U.S. Department ofEnergy.

Forward Wisconsin,
Wisconsin

Contact: Jim Halverson or Dennis Blang, President
Address: 316 W. Washington Ave., Suite105

Madison, WI 53703
Phone: (608) 256-4556
Fax: (608) 252-2083

Forward Wisconsin, a unique non-profit cooperative venture, works to attract new
businesses to the state and to promote in-state expansions. Forward Wisconsin works to
boost the state's image within and outside the state by projecting the state's positive
business climate and attracting industry to Wisconsin The corporation's marketing plan
focuses its resources on the forest products sector as one of their ten target industries.
Forward Wisconsin uses a wide range of economic development marlceting tools which
include: direct mail campaigns to targeted industries and geographic areas; out-of-state .
prospecting trips; trade show booth !1ppearances at targeted industry expositions; print
advertising campaigns directed toward geographically targeted publications and target
industry journals; and special event promotions. Forward Wisconsin also provides site
and community infonnation. utility and tax comparisons, financial information. and a
variety of other services to prospective businesses.

Forward Wisconsin was created in 1984 on the recommendation of a 1983 Marketing
Wisconsin Task Force Repon. Forward Wisconsin's funding is provided by the state
through a contract with the Department of Development, and by private sector contribu­
tors.
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Govemor's Council on Forestry,
Ohio

Contact: William Jd"lnson
Address: Box 810

Hayward, WI 54843
Phone: 015) 634-4843
Fax: 015) 634-5755

The Governor's Council on Forestry, composed ofstate representatives and private
industry, monitors the industIy and advises the Governor regarding legislation that will
promote economic growth on a state and national level It has created an excellent
relationship between the Governor and industry, and promoted a better understanding of
the industry and national forests. The council has also been successful on budgetary.
items that are relevant to the growth of the forestry sector, and has worked with the
Department of Natural Resources, providing forestry appreciation to the state's school
systein.

Illinois CouncH on Forestry Development,
Illinois

Contact: AI Mickelson
Address: 218 W.lawrence St.

Springfield,IL 62704
Phone: (217) 523-5442
Fax: (217) 523-5528

The Illinois Council on Forestry Development, fonned by the General Assembly Council
of Illinois in 1983. targets primary and secondary wood products. The ForestIy Develop­
ment Act was initiated to address long-standing concerns in the mid-west: high land
cost, high investment, longer return, and high risk. TIle Council helped establish a cost
share program for self financing via a 4 percent harvest fee on all timber cut in Illinois.
provides an analysis of resources in the state, and makes recommendations to agencies
and legislators.
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Illinois Deportment of Conservation, DMsion of Forestry,
Illinois

Contact: John Sester
Address: 60J N. Grand Ave.

P.O. Box 19225
Springville, IL 62794

1be Division ofForestry, within the illinois Department of Conservation, works on
economic development proposals and timber bridge development. and releases a publica­
tion to industry on export leads. It also has a monthly newsletter that includes infonna­
tion about the wood products industry.

Indiana Wood Products Competitiveness Study,
Indiana

Contact: Graham Toft or Susan Koch
Address: 1N. Capitol, Suite 425

Indianapolis, IN 46204
Phone: (317) 631-0871

The Indiana Wood Products Competitiveness Study (IWPC) assessed the competitive
position of Indiana's wood products industry. It identified challenges facing the industry,
fonnulated options to address these challenges, arid recommended implementation
strategies for each option.

1bis project was initiated by State Division of Forestry and was funded by a federal
forestJy grant The Division ofForestry contracted with IEDC to carry out the study and
final results will be released jointly. 1be IWPC study also had extensive private sector
involvement from an advisory panel made up of industry representatives.

Lake State Lumber Association,
Michigan

Contact: Bob Owens
Address: (at Association) P.O. Box 296

Iron Mountain, MI 49801
Phone: (218) 724-9486
Fax: (218) 723-1151

The non-profit Lake State Lumber Association is composed of primary saw mill manu­
facturers, value added operations, secondary manufacturers (furniture and cabinet
makers), and suppliers. 1bis association has oriented its efforts toward hardwoods in the
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primary and secondary wood products industry. Its objectives are to: protect timber
supply to maintain a sustained yield; project a favorable industry impression to the public
through promotion programs; lobby efforts at the state level for workers compensation
and transportation concerning stonn water run off, and related forestry issues; and
educate members to improve the profitability.

The Lake State Lumber Association worked for passage of the Ottawa National Forest
Plan. a balanced forest plan which takes into consideration biodiversity, scenic beauty,
water quality, and timber harvesting.

Michigan Grand River Guild,
Michigan

Contact: Jim Malnight
Address: 1400 McKay Tower

146 Monroe Center
Grand Rapids, MI 49503

Phone: (616) 454-Q979
Fax: (503) 388-6362 (in Oegon)

(616) 454-7734

The Michigan Grand River Guild, a non-profit organization, was fonned by the Depan~
mem of Commerce in Michigan and mainly targets secondary wood products. The
Grand River Guild is currently working with 17 companies in 3 states to help them with
product development and bring them together with other companies and dealers.

Mississippi Forest Products Laboratory, Mississippi State University,
Mississippi

Contact: Harold Stewart
Address: P.O. Drawer F.P.

Mississippi State, MS 39762-5724
Phone: (601) 325-2116
Fax: (601) 325-8126

The Mississippi Forest Products Laboratory at Mississippi State University researches
toolware mechanisms and the mechanics of chip fonnation for the development of
longer-lasting tools with a higher suiface quality. It also has a furniture research unit and
provides technical assistance to wood manufacturers in the area of wood machinery.
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Missouri Deportment of Conservation,
Missouri

Contact: Shelby Jones
Address: P.O. Box 180

Jefferson City, MO 65102
Phone: (314) 751-4115
Fax: (314) 893-tlJ79

TIle Missouri Department of Conservation provides teelmical assistance to all sectors of
the forest industry on a request basis and handles rural development forestry. 1bis
department has a Forest Resource Data Center which has proven to be a valuable
infonnation source for industries. It supplies infonnation referrals, provides analysis and
interpretation, and is proactive in economic development and marlceting. One of the
department's most important functions is compiling and distributing funding for rural
development It also works closely with forest product trade associations; has a proactive
international marlceting program; manages EI.A. data in-house; and coordinates resource
measurement TIle Department of Conservation also works with other agencies on
projects.

Missouri Forest Products Association,
Missouri

Contact: Sandy Wallendorf
Address: 611 E. Capital Ave., Suite 1

Jefferson City, MO 65101
Phone: (314) 634-3252
Fax: (314) 636-2591

The Missouri Forest Products Association membership includes loggers, wood products
manufacturers, forest land owners, and government agencies involved in forestry. The
association holds two annual meetings, provides educational services, and keeps in touch
with legislative members on current legislation. It also conducts educational workshops
for members and keeps them infonned of what is being done in the wood products
industry.

The Missouri Forest Products Association has also served as a liaison for its members
and the Department of Natural Resources.
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Northern Economic Initiatives Corporation.
The U.P. Fumiture Manufacturers Network,
Michigan

Contact: Richard Anderson
Address: 1009 West Ridge Street

Marquette, M149855
Phone: (9()6) 228-5571
Fox: (906) 228-5572

The Northern Economic Initiatives Corporation (NEICorp), supported by funding from
the Midwest Manufacturing Technology Center, was designed as a three pronged
program to accomplish three goals. First. NElCorp's secondary wood strategy aims to
modernize the front operations of the region's small to medium-sized wood manufactur­
ers by assisting participants with assessing their computer needs, jointly ordering equip­
ment for modest savings, structuring a training culliculum, and helping these firms
understand and build on their core competencies as manufacturers. Secondly, NEICorp
strives to reduce bottle necks in productivity facilitating quarterly meetings and tours
among the Upper Peninsula's five major furniture and associated wood product manufac­
turers. This fosters comfortable networking relationships which encourage the develop­
ment of component supplier relationships with smaller wood manufacturers. 11Iirdly,
NElCorp aims to establish an alliance between itself and the Michigan Association of
Ttrnbennen by offering strategic planning, counseling, and assistance. 11Iis alliance may
help NElCorp deliver marlcet-driven programs to associated members.

U.S. Forest service.
Illinois North Central Forest Experiment Station.
Illinois

Contact: Peter V.S. Chen or J.W. Van Sombeek
Address: Forest Sciences Lab, SIU

Carbondale,IL 62901
Phone: (618) 453-2318
Fax: (618) 453-2911

The North Central Forest Experiment Station, with the United States Forest Service,
targets the secondary wood products industry. 1lle program works on projects with the
Walnut Council, the National Fores~ Products Association, and the Illinois Council on
Forestry Development TIle research mission of the Carbondale Forestry Sciences
Laboratory is to develop the physiological and genetic knowledge needed to produce
improved planting stock, improve tree growth, develop better artificial regeneration
prescriptions for central hardwood species, determine the influence ofvarious manage­
ment practices on wood properties and product quality of central hardwood species, and
develop better uses for low-quality trees in the Central Hardwood Region to enhance
forest-based economies in rural America
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The North Central Forest Experiment Station has published articles outlining the rela­
tionship between silviculture practices, log grade (especially for veneer), and wood
quality.

University of Illinois at Urbana-Champaign,
Illinois

Contact: Dick Brazee or Anthony Pugel
Address: Dept. of Forestry, W-fJJ3 Tumer Hall

1102 S. Goodwin
Urbana,IL 61801

Phone: (217) 333-6271
Fax: (217) 244-3219

Dick Brazee's research team conducts research on biodiversity issues. It has also worked
on issues related to timber harvesting and the development of second best solutions when
there are serious revenue constraints. Researchers are also working on environmental
protection and price distortion for natural resources, especially in the area ofLatin
America.

Dr. Anthony Pugel's research team has worked to create a hardwood database containing
2000 articles on hardwood exporting and dIying. The team is currently compiling a
directory for secondary manufacturing.

Wisconsin Department of Agriculture and Trade and Consumer
Production in Marketing,
Wisconsin

Contact: Jeff Duffin
Address: 801 W. Budget Rd.

P.O. Box 8911
Madison, WI 53713

Phone: (608) 266-2221
Fax: (608)266-1300

The Wisconsin Department of Agriculture and Trade and Consumer Production in
Marketing coordinates international'export activities with the Wisconsin Department of
Natural Resources. It receives trade leads and conducts trade missions to Asia, Italy, and
Japan, and also brings foreign buyers to Wisconsin. The Department has also developed
a Lake State Export Directory of wood product manufacturers in the state, established a
database of forest product suppliers, and provided assistance and consulting on export
regulations and import restrictions.
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WISConsin Department of Natural Resources,
WISConsin

Contact: Terry Mace
Address: 3911 FISh Hatchery Rd.

Fitchburg, W1,53711
Phone: (608) 275-3276
Fax: (608) 275-3338

TIle Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources Forest Products Unit promotes the
better use of Wisconsin's forest resource by strengthening its forest industry, maintaining
or increasing existing jobs, and utilizing swplus forest resources through expansion of
the state's forest products industry. Retention of the state's primary and secondary forest
industry is achieved through technical assistance to individual fums, state economic
development agencies, communities, and regional planning commissions. TIle depart­
ment also works to marlret the state's primary, secondary, and wood-based recycling
forest products industry to develop international marlcets. Other functions the department
perfonns include: providing training for forest products teclmology transfer; providing
forest industry surveys and inventory analysis; promoting public awareness; and helping
to administer federal programs designed to manage and use natural resources for ec0­

nomic growtIi.

During the last several years, the Forest Products Unit has been involved in a multitude
of activities designed to strengthen Wisconsin's forest industry and its overall economy.
The unit has provided wood using industries with wood availability infonnation, result­
ing in the establishment of several lumber related product mills in the state, and employ­
ing more workers. In addition, a pulpmill siting study for the Governor was completed in
1989 which may lead to more pulping capacity and substantial investment in the state.
Wood availability studies completed in conjunction with the Northwest Regional Plan­
ning Commission could aid in locating new wood industries in Northwest WiSCOnsin.

The Forest Products Unit has worked with Forward Wisconsin to promote business
development by attending forest product trade shows in the United States, Europe and
Japan. It also assisted in compiling the Tri-State Forest Product Export Directory
(prepared jointly with Wisconsin, Michigan, and Minnesota), which has been sent to 500
companies in 28 countries.

WISConsin Pri-Ru-To RC & DCooneR,
Wisconsin

Contact: Lee Hanks
Address: 153 S. 2nd St.

Medford. WI 54451
Phone: 015) 748-2008
Fax: 015) 748-4841

TIle Pri-Ru-Ta RC & D Council is made up of a Council of County Board members and
targets general, primary, and secondary wood products. One current project involves
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assisting a paper company with a feasibility study to investigate types ofpaper to be
manufactured profitably. The council also funded a 1992 project where it woIked with a
small company maIketing alternative forest products.

Southem Ohio Wood Flexible Manufacturing Network,
Ohio

Contact: Jeff Spencer. Ivy Steele
Address: 740 second Street

Portsmouth, OH 45662
Phone: (614) 354-7795
Fax: (614) 353-<>353

The Southern Ohio Wood Flexible Manufacturing NetwoIk is a regional planning
commission providing technical assistance to wood product manufacturers. The organi­
zation assists with grant writing, safety training, management practices, and financial
packaging. It also co-sponsors woIkshops on wood manufacturing. TIlls organization
receives some assistance through the U.S. Forest Service Extension SeIVice and selVes
11 Appalachian counties.
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Appendix III-Northwest

City of lhome Bay,
Alaska

Contact: Ginny Tiemey
Address: P.O. Box 19110

Thome Bay, AK 99919
Phone: (907) 828-3380
Fax: (907) 828-3374

The City ofThome Bay assists the primary and secondary wood product industries with
materials availability and transport and with site acquisitions for operations. By lobbying
the state government to make parcels of state land available for commercial and indus­
trial use, the city has fonned a close relationship with other public agencies.

The City ofThome Bay has been successful in identifying, subdividing, and releasing
state lands appropriate for commercial and industrial development

aackamas County Wood Products
Response Team,
Oregon

Contact: Gary Kuhn
Address: P.O. Box 215

Marylhurst, OR 97036
Phone: (503) 635-9137
Fax: (503) 635-8946

The Wood Products Response Team in Oackamas County was fonned to prepare for the
possible dislocation of wood products workers and the effects of resource priority
management on the wood products industry. The identifies resources, develops and
coordinates services, and disseminates information to assist timber dependent communi­
ties and affected individuals in the county. The volunteer membership is divided into

. two groups. The Immediate Response Group has arranged skill-building classes for mill
workers and dissemination of information about services for dislocated and potentially
dislocated workers. The Long Range Planning Group has worked extensively with
Qackamas Community College and the Associated General Contractors to establish a
pre-apprenticeship program to help dislocated wood workers build marlcetable skills in
the construction industry.

'The Wood Products Response Team interacts with mills and businesses in surrounding
rural communities, and works with local, state, and federal agencies on economic
development and forestry issues. The Team organized computer classes for wood
products workers, and has published an Annual Mill Status Report.
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Economic Development Association of Skagit County,
Washington

Contact: Gary Arentzen
Address: P.O. Box 40

Third &Montgomery
Mt. Vernon, WA98273

Phone: (206) 336-6114
Fax: (206) 336-6116

1be Economic Development Association of Skagit COWlty offers business and technical
assistance to established wood products manufacturers individually and through WOlX­

shops. It identifies markets for manufacturers and facilitates networking among manu­
facturers with various resources such as: sources of material; financing; and specialty
sub-contracts (contractors). It also works with various local, state, and federal agencies
to coordinate these selVices.

Evergreen Partnership,
Washington

Contact: Greg SChellberg
Address: World Trade Center, Suite #f:1J2

3600 Port ofTacoma Rd. E.
Tacoma, WA 98424

Phone: (206) 922-6640
Fax: (206) 922-2769

The Evergreen Partnership is a private non-profit organization established by Washing­
ton government and private interests to represent and serve the forest products and
building materials industry. It aids in the development and expansion of international
and domestic markets for Pacific Northwest wood products and building materials by
selVing as a focal point for marketing infonnation and activity. Potential customers
make inquiries concerning resources, selVices, and markets directly to the partnership.

1be Evergreen Partnership also develops education programs so that significant timely
market information can be effectively disseminated to the industry; and attempts to
develop relationships with home builders throughout the Pacific Rim by introducing
them to regional firms through trade missions, home shows, plant tours, dinners, and .
receptions. This organization curreQtly has an international database that includes over
500 perspective buyers of housing materials and has instituted a forest products indus­
tries' public awareness campaign to educate the public on the industry's importance to
the region's economy.

The 19-member Board of Directors has ten seats reselVed for forest products and build­
ing materials industry representatives, and the department heads from the Washington
Departments of Natural Resources and Trade and Economic Development automatically
fill two positions.
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Flathead Economic Development Corporation,
Montana

Contact: Carol Daly
Address: 777 Grandview

Kalispell, MT 59901
Phone: (406) 756-8548
Fax: (406) 765-3815

TIle Flathead Economic Development Corporation establishes networlcs and focuses on
one-<>n-<>ne marketing efforts with individual companies. It also supports science and
technology research and development for private operators. TIle program aims to build
consensus on land-use plans county-wide and implements appropriate regulations and
incentives. TIle Rathead Economic Development Corporation has established a commu­
nity-wide Total Quality Management program for manufacturers, service businesses, and
government agencies to increase value and efficiency of production and services. It also
explores options for life-long learning programs, especially as they relate to worker or
employer training and retraining.

Eighty percent of the funds for the Flathead Economic Development Corporation come
from the private sector, with the remaining twenty percent coming from Flathead County
and the cities of Whitefish, Kalispell, and Columbia Falls.

lewis County Economic Development Council,
Washington

Contact: Pam Brown
Address: P.O. Box 916

Chehalis, WA 98532
Phone: (206) 748-0114

TIle Lewis County Economic Development Council coordinates with the Department of
Trade and Economic Development to arrange meetings with wood product manufaewr­
ers and other groups. This organization assists with community development, emphasiz­
ing long-term visions and diversification. It worlcs with managers on surveys, special
challenges, and seminars that will help reduce manufacturers' costs. Other functions the
council provides include market development of international opportunities and broker
information.
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Montana Competitiveness Council,
Montana

Contact: Christine Mangiantini
Address: P.O. Box 613

Helena, MT 59624
Phone: (406) 443-2434
Fax: (406) 443-2702

The Montana Competitiveness Council (MCC) is interested in establishing a regional
advisory group to work on regional legislation and other efforts. It recently hosted a
conference in Missoula on flexible manufacturing networks, as a part of its work with
manufacturing firms to promote linkages. An upcoming study examines existing
networks, linkages, productivity, and competition in Montana. A fleXible manufacturing
demonstration project is currently being established in eight countiesjn Southwestern
Montana. .

Okanogan County Resource Roundtable,
Washington

Contact: Elaine Omachi
Address: Box 1042

Omok, WA 98841
Phone: (Ef:Jf) 826-5107 or (fff}) 826-3502
Fax: (fI:Fl) 826-1812

The Okanogan County Resource Roundtable is a volunteer cooperative of craft and
wood-workers providing support for expansion activities. Their work includes market
research. education and training workshops. and a newsletter. It is a resource for existing
small wood crafts businesses as well as for timber workers who are starting one up. The
Roundtable serves as a liaison between the timber workers and financial institutions, and
as a guide to business management and marketing information.

Working with administrative and office support from the Okanogan County Council for
Economic Development and other public agencies. the cooperative has increased market­
ing efforts and is planning to enter the group in a trade show. In addition, two spin-off
businesses are being started by craftworker members.
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Oregon Economic Development Department,
Regional Strategies Program,
Oregon

Contact: Theresa Taaffe
Kathleen Gardipee

Address: 775 Summer Sf. NE
Solem, OR 97310

Phone: (503) 373-7361

The Regional Strategies Program in the Oregon Economic Development Department is
both a planning process and a grant program. The region identifies three to four indus­
tries to undergo an industry assessment and then chooses a key industry focus.

Primarily a county program. the Key Strategies Program serves on regional committees.
In addition. the private sector was contacted during the development of the key industry
assessments. Representatives from govenunent serve on its Regional Committees and
participate in the project review process. The U.S. Forest Service and the State Depan­
ment of Forestry are also primary partners.

Oregon Economic Development Department,
Rexible Networks for Oregon Business,
Key Indusfries Development Program,
Oregon

Contact: Janet Jones
Address: 775 Summer St. N.E.

Solem, OR 97310
Phone: (503) 378-2286
Fax: (503) 581-5115

The Key Industries Development Program in the Oregon Economic Development
Deparunent was created through Senate Bill 997. which called for the development of
flexible networks in key industries. This program. created in 1991 by the Oregon
legislature. works to facilitate networks as one way to encourage existing small busi­
nesses to work together to become more competitive in the global marketplace.

The program is implemented in pannership with the business community and key
industry trade associations. It also works closely with the Oregon Wood Products
Competitiveness Corporation on grant awards for proposals that mainly involve the
forest products industry. Grants are lottery funded.
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Oregon Marketplace,
Oregon

Contact: Brenda Chetham
Address: 618 Uncoln Street

Eugene, OR 97401
Phone: (503) 343-7712
Fax: (503) 687-4899

The Oregon Marketplace is based on the concept of import substitution, replacing
previously imported goods and services with local products, resulting in the economic
development of the local economy. A network. of regional programs is linked through a
central office clearinghouse and a statewide computer network. and database. Field
brokers conduct searches on behalfof purchasers for Oregon businesses to respond to
contract opportunities.

Oregon State University Extension,
Unn-Benton Regional Strategy,
Oregon

Contact: Robin Galloway
Address: 550 South Main St.

Lebanon, OR 97355
Phone: (503) 258-3181
Fax: (503) 258-3420

The Linn-Benton Regional Strategy with the Oregon State University Extension is a two­
county pannership working to help businesses plan for the future by encouraging the
implementation of new ideas and teclmology. lbis program provides businesses with
technical assistance and financial support. It also has a business incubator facility for
new and existing businesses that create a new crop, product, process, or service. High
technology, agriculture, and forestry are the key industries selected for emphasis. This
program hopes the use of new ideas and technology will diversify local industry and add
value through new processing opportunities.

The Linn-Benton Regional Strategy is administered by the Oregon Economic Develop­
ment Department through its Regional Strategies Unit Commissioners ofLinn and
Benton Counties work. closely with program planning.
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Oregon Sfate University Extension Service,
Timber-Dependent Families & Communities Project,
Oregon

Contact: Raxen Conway
Address: Dept. of Agr. & Resource Economics,

Ballard Hall 213
CONallis, OR 97331-3601

Phone: (503) 737-1418
Fax: (503) 737-3601

The TImber-Dependent Fainilies & Communities Project was initiated in 1991 with OSU
Extension taking the lead. It is a university-wide effon to draw on existing resources to
design materials and deliver broad-based educational programs to create bridges between
OSU's resources and timber-dependent communities and families. The program is
located in 36 local county extension offices, and works with the private sector via
coalitions and projects.

The program has developed the following educational materials: "Managing Between
Jobs;" "Family & Youth Tool Kit;" and "Community Tool Kit"

Overseas Sfrategic services,
Oregon

Contact: James Thayer
Address: World Trade Center

121 S.W. Salmon St., Suite 1100
Portland, OR 97204

Phone: (503) 223-3449
Fax: (503) 223-5841

As a private international management finn. Overseas Strategic Services offers U.S.
finns direct hands on assistance with which to enter the European market and perfonn
contract work for state and federal agencies. Marketing services include the identifica­
tion and evaluation of specialized distributors, and introducing important professional
service to providers. Coilsulting services are also provided for the establishment of
strategic alliances between the U.S. and European firms.

The finn has developed two strategic alliances in Europe and has World Bank funding
approval for a major project there. The company is expanding its client base to include
firms across the U.S. and Europe.
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Pacific Wood Products Cooperative,
Washington

Contact: Carrie Colson
Address: P,O. Box 1422

ChehaflS, WA 98532
Phone: (206) 748-1597
Fax: (206) 748{)9()3

1be Pacific Wood Products Cooperative is a network cooperative that works with wood
manufacturers to develop products and markets. It also conducts market analysis for a
variety of projects in several counties.

Puget Sound Cooperative Federation,
Washington

Contact: Carol DiMorcello
Address: 4649 Sunnyside Ave. N., #323

seattle, WA 98103
Phone: (206) 632-4559

The Puget Sound Cooperative Federation, established in 1979, is an association of
consumers and worker-owned businesses with programs throughout Washington and in
Oregon and Alaska. The Cooperative Federation helps foster the success of cooperative
enterprises by providing business assistance in organizational development, short and
long range planning, market analysis, business plan development, financial training, and
problem solving methods.

Working in collaboration oncommunity-based economic development projects with the
State Department of Community Development, this cooperative organization encourages
the application of flexible manufacturing network concepts in its development work with
cooperative businesses. It.

Southem Oregon Regional Economic Development, Inc.,
Oregon

Contact: Corky Leister
Address: 132 W. Main, Suite 101

Medford, OR 97501-2746
Phone: (503) 773-8946
Fax: (503) 779-ff(53

Southern Oregon Regional Economic Development, Inc. is a private nonprofit organiza­
tion which works to promote the creation and retention ofjobs through marketing,
expansion. and diversification of Southern Oregon's economic base. It recruits and
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assists new industries from outside the region, helping them retain and expand their local
businesses. It also coordinates and facilitates local and regional efforts to increase family
wage jobs in Southern Oregon. Other assistance this organization provides includes fin­
ancing, relocation, development and growth. press conferences, and resource networicing.

Tradec,
Washington

Contact: SCott Jackson
Address: 600 University Sf., Suite 2801

seattle, WA 98101
Phone: (206) 224-4240
Fax: (206) 224-4344

Tradec is a private firm performing trade development and madret promotion for wood
manufacturers. It targets general wood products and assesses market demands in the
general wood industry. This firm is looking at creating a cooperative to market finns
internationally and is especially interested in marketing wood products in Japan, Taiwan,
and Europe. This company also works collaboratively on projects with the Washington
State Department ofTrade and Economic Development

Tradec has implemented a number of international trade promotion projects in the wood
products industry which include an APA Program and Export Expo '93.

U.S. Department of Agriculture,
Pacific Northwest Research Station,
Oregon

Contact: Roger Rght
Address: P.O. Box 3890

Portland, OR 97208
Phone: (503) 321-5804
Fax: (503) 321-5901

The Pacific Northwest Research Station primarily researches how pruning can provide
clearer wood for secondary wood manufacturers. 1bis is an indirect link to value added
efforts because pruning creates a high quality wood product. The production of the high
quality of clear lumber through investing in pruning will add value to the wood har­
vested. This has an important implication for manufacturers who are looking at a
diminishing wood supply.
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University of Alaska, Fairbanks,
Utilization Program for Alaska Woods,
Alaska

Contact: Tony Gasbarro
Address: Cooperative Extension service

University of Alaska
Fairbanks, AK W775-5200

Phone: (907) 474-6356
Fax: (907) 474-7439

The Utilization Program for Alaska Woods (upAW) is an infonnal group ofdepart­
ments on the University of Alaska, Fairbanks campus and is affiliated with the USDA
Forest Service. 111is program explores research and development needs, plant size
feasibility, product specifications, and financing and marketing strategies. In November·
of 1990, it sponsored a workshop on value-added opportunities for Alaska forest prod­
ucts. The workshop objectives included the examination of the potential for increasing
the use of Alaska's tree species for engineered wood products, wood structures, and
extractive chemicals. It also aimed to identify strategies for developing and financing
this potential and providing technical suppon for designers and producers. The program
is working to develop an action program for the use of Alaska tree species and to pro­
mote value added forest products industries in Alaska.

University of Alaska Southeast,
Economic Development Center,
Alaska

Contact: C.L. Cheshire
Address: Ketchikan Campus

7th & Madison
Ketchikan, AK 9W0l-5798

Phone: (907) 225-6171
Fax: (907) 225-3895

The Economic Development Center at the University of Alaska Southeast was fonned
through an appropriation from the Ketchikan Gateway Borough to identify ways to
attract wood manufacturers to the region. A feasibility study prepared for the Southeast
Conference in 1991 encourages value added timber manufacturing in Southeast Alaska

. 111is study recommends that Alaska wood products industry should: increase timber
employment where it is declining due to rising round log expons; take advantage of a
rising demand abroad, particularly in Japan, for finished building materials and western
style construction; and take advantage of the West Coast's highly developed industrial
infrastructure. The study was intended to initiate public exploration of value added
opportunities.



University of Idaho,
Forest Products Department,
Wood Use &Design Program,
Idaho

Contact: Dr. Tom Gorman
Address: Conege of Forestry, Wildlife and Range SCiences

University of Idaho
Moscow,ID 83843-4199

Phone: (208) 885-7402
Fax: (208)885-6226

TIle Forest Products Depanment at the University of Idaho focuses on identifying new
marlcets for wood products, helping timber-dependent communities diversify, conducting
business feasibility and mill studies that explore adding value to the processing for prim­
ary wood products. It is also working with three timber-dependent communities in Idaho
on their Fann Bill plan, which would provide funding for economic diversification and
sustainability. TIle Depattment has also compiled a descriptive analysis ofIdaho's forest
products industry, which includes information on the secondary wood products industIy.

TIle Wood Use & Design Program was established by industry to increase the shrinking
population of students in wood products programs. It provides educational programs for
sawmills workers and owners to help them better understand the new technology coming
into the industry. The program also wanted to provide tactical applied research, which is
funded by private industry.

University of Montana,
Bureau of Business and Economic Research,
Montana

Contact: Charles Keegan
Address: Missoula, MT 59812
Phone: (406) 243-5113 .
Fox: (406) 243-2086

TIle Bureau of Business and Economic Research is the research branch of the School of
Business Administration at the University ofMontana. This unit targets general and
primary wood and paper products. A single analysis of the Montana industry has grown
into comprehensive studies of the Montana, Wyoming, and Idaho industries. The
Bureau has also studied Arizona, Colorado and Wyoming forest product operations. In
cooperation with the US. Forest Service, the Bureau developed the Forest Industries Data
Collection System (FIDACS) to survey forest products firms in western states. FIDACS
produces information about the nwnber and size of mills, the types ofproducts produced,
the source and ownership of the industry's timber supply, capacity utilization, and
destination markets for finished products. The Bureau produces a comprehensive report
on Montana and Idaho firms every five years. TIle Forest Service, utilizing ADACS,
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conducts research in other states and the resulting infonnation is stored at the Bureau. In
cooperation with the Montana Wood Products Association. the Bureau conducts the
quarterly Forest Industries Infonnation System survey, which provides current infonna­
tion on employment, wages, production expenditures, and timber use in the state's forest
products industry to the media and others. Recently, the Bureau worked with the
University ofMontana School of Forestry collecting data to develop a directory of
secondary wood products manufacturers in Montana

'The Bureau of Business and Economic Research perfonns contract work and is a clear­
inghouse for infonnation on various aspects of the industry. It also works cooperatively
with federal and state agencies both in and outside ofMontana, providing infonnation.

University of Montana,
School of Forestry,
Montana

Contact: Edwin Burke
Address: Missoula, MT 59812
Phone: (406) 243-5521
Fax: (406) 243-4845

The School ofForestry at the University ofMontana targets general and secondary wood
products, conducting feasibility studies on assistance to organizations doing marketing
efforts. It is also conducting a feasibility study on an Inland Northwest Regional Re­
search & Development Program for secondary wood products. The school often con­
tracts with the Small Business Administration.

The School of Forestry has completed a directory of secondary industry in Montana,
made an overview assessment of secondary industry in the state, and completed a pilot
program in marketing assistance.

University of Washington,
Center for International Trade in Forest Products, (CINTRAFOR),
Washington

Contact: Bruce Uppke. Director
Address: College of Forest Resources, AR-1 0

University of Washington
Seattle, WA 98195

Phone: (206) 543-8684
Fax: (206) 543-3254

The Center for International Trade in Forest Products addresses opportunities and
programs related to the international trade of wood and fiber products. The Center
emphasizes forest economics and policy analysis, trade and environment, teclmology
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development. marlceting, and value added wood products. CINTRAFOR's Value Added
Wood Products Program provides information to the manufacturers of wood products in
the Pacific Northwest 1lle core of CIN1RAFOR's research program is a comprehen­
sive and integrated set of studies addressing key problems and opponunities inherent in
the international trade of forest products. Five emphasis areas comprise CINfRAFOR's
research: Pacific Rim Forest Products Trade Assessment, International Wood Construc­
tion Research, Country Market Profiles and Special Study Topics, and a Global Trade
Model (GTM).

CINTRAFOR produces many publications and panicipates in over 20 major confer­
ences. It has also received the Sunset Review Committee Endorsement. CINTRAFOR
has close ties with wood products businesses, foreign consumers, and policymalcers on
all government levels.

u.s. Department of Commerce,
Northwest TMC (Trade Adjustment Assistance Center),
Washington

Contact: Robert Miller
Address: 900 Fourth Ave.• Suite 2430

Seattle. WA 98164-1003
Phone: (206) 622-2730
Fax: (206) 622-1105

1lle NorthwestTAAC, in existence since 1974, is funded by the U.S. Department of
Commerce to help U.S. manufacturers struggling to compete with imported products
regain their competitiveness. Companies that have experienced recent declines in sales
and employment due to increasing import competition are eligible to participate in the
program. 1lle federal government pays up to 75 percent of the cost of consulting
services designed to help the client firm improve its competitive position. Typical
projects eligible for program funds include: market studies; export assistance; ISO 9(xx)
registration; plant engineering improvements; worlcer incentive plans; marketing promo­
tionalliterature; cost systems; the development of management information systems; and
general financial and management consulting. 1llere is no cost to apply to the program.

'The Northwest TAAC worlcs with companies to help them design successful strategies to
compete with lower priced imports. The Northwest TAAC is funded by the U.S. Depar­
tment of Commerce and administered by twelve regional organizations nationwide.
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Washington Department of Community Development,
Timber Public Works Trust Fund,
Washington

Contact: Karin Berkholtz
Address: 906 Columbia St. S.W.

P.O. Box 48319
Olympia, WA 98504-8319

Phone: (206) 753-4283
Fax: (206) 586-6868

The Tunber Public Works Trust Fund is administered by the State Washington Depart­
ment of Community Development to provide loans for new or expanded infrastruCUJre
projects in communities in designated timber-impacted areas. The fund also provides for
increased diversified economic opportunities for residents of timber dependent areas of
Washington state. Project feasibility is a primary consideration.

Washington State Department of Trade &Economic Development,
Community Economic Revitalization Board,
Washington

Contact: Kathleen Engle
Address: 2001 6th Ave, Suite 2700

Seattle, WA 98121
Phone: (206) 464-6282
Fax: (206) 464-5868

The Community Economic Revitalization Board is a program established in 1991 in the
Washington Department ofTrade & Economic Development to provide loans or grants
to communities in designated timber-impacted areas. Funds are provided for new
infrastructure projects to support potential industrial or tourism projects, and improve
economic development and diversification opportunities.

CERB 's public infrastructure supports private business development in job creation and
retraining. Its staff are represented on the Economic DevelopmentSubcommittee of the
Governor's Timber Task Force. The Economic Development Subcommittee, comprised
of state, federal and local govemment representatives, provides a forum for discussing
potential projects and issues, and coordinates state and federal finance assistance.
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Washington State Export Assistance center, .
Washington

Contact: Ken Keach
Address: 2001 Sixth Ave., Suite 2100

Seatt1e, WA 98121
Phone: (206) 464-7123
Fax: (206) 587-4224

The Export Assistance Center was created by mandate by the Washington State Legisla­
ture in 1990, and has close ties to the Washington Department ofTrade and Economic
Development. TIle Export Assistance Center provides export financing assistance to
small and mid-size businesses. These services include the following: delivering export
transaction training and export finance counseling; detennining the financial risk of
specific export transactions; detennining the payment tenns and 5UUCtlJre for appropriate
funding; and identifying and introducing sources of export-related financial services.

The Pacific Northwest Export Assistance Project (pNEAP) is geared to helping timber
manufaeture~. By mandate from the legislature, the PNEAP must serve 50 percent of
the timber-impacted communities. This project works with small to medium manufac­
ture~ who could potentially increase exports or who find it difficult to enter the export­
ing arena

Washington Department of Trade and Economic Development,
Forest Products Division,
Washington

Contact: Kay Gabriel
Connie Taylor

Address: 919 Lakeridge Way S.W., Suite A
Olympia, WA 98502

Phone: (206) 586-1871 or (206) 753-3065
Fax: (206) 586-4849

'The Forest Products Division of the Washington Department ofTrade & Economic
Development was fonned by the legislature in 1989 (HB 134i) and receives funding
from the U.S. Forest Service from a Revolving Loan Fund. The Forest Products Divi­
sion provides policy development, initiates programs, and gives technical assistance to
small and medium-sized forest product companies. The division provides grants for
technical and market feasibility studies for value added manufacturing, and loans for
value added manufacturing equipment. It also works closely with other state economic
development agencies and is an active member of Governor's TimberTask Force and its
Economic Development Subcommittee.
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Washington Governor's Timber Team,
Washington State legislature,
Washington

Contact: Rich Nafziger
Address: 2400 Capital Way, Room 201, QE-22

Olympia, WA 98504
Phone: (206) 586-4046
Fax: (206) 586-4162

The Governor's Timber Team in Washington State has been in existence for three yeaIS
and uses legislation and other policy instruments to taIget general, primary, and second­
ary wood products. The Team is currently worldng on bills in Washington to provide
economic assistance, training, and re-training to timber-impacted areas in Washington.

Washington University Cooperative Extension,
(Westem & Eastern Divisions)
Washington

Western
Contact: James Freed
Address: 9 Federal Building

Shelton, WA 98584
Phone: (206) 427-9660·
Fax: (206) 427-7264

Eastern
Contact: Peter Griessman
Address: 230 \tViliiams Lake Road

Colville, WA 99114
Phone: (ElF) 684-2588
Fax: (ElF) 684-8310

The Washington State University Cooperative Extension helps people develop leader­
ship skills and use research-based knowledge through seminars and other educational
programs. The Western Division is concerned primarily with Agroforestry, while the
Eastern Division targets primary and secondary wood products. Both extension divisions
worlc with individual companies and associations providing training and basic research.

The Western Division has helped new business get started, new practices used, and new
and improved products developed. The Eastern Division has provided small businesses
with more business management information and has found niche marlcets for existing
commodity-based lumber businesses.
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WoodNet,
Washington

Contact: Gus Kostopulos
Address: 127 E. Rrst Suite 4W

Port Angeles, WA 98362
Phone: (206) 452-2134
Fax: (206) 452-7065

WoodNet, a non-profit organization fonned in 1991, sets up manufacturing networlcs on
the Olympic Peninsula between the manufacturers of such diverse products as: arts &
crafts; construction products; mills; marine products; and home furnishings and fixtures.
It is fimded by a Northwest Area Foundation grant along with such state and federal
agencies as U.S. Forest SeIVice, Washington State Department ofTrade & Economic
Development, the Export Assistance Center, and the Department of Community Devel­
opment.

WoodNet has been involved in various local, state, and international trade shows, and
has produced an Olympic Peninsula consumer products wholesale catalog, and a net­
working newsletter for members. WoodNet is also working with the Export Assistance
Center on ajoint demonstration project

Wood Products Competitiveness Corporation,
Oregon

Contact: Ray Daffner
Address: 20354 Empire Avenue, Suite D-3

Bend, OR 97701
Phone: (503) 388-6372 or (800) 548-8438
Fax: (503) 388-<>362

The Wood Products Competitiveness Corporation (WPCC) is charged with assisting the
state's secondary wood products industry in becoming the finest, most competitive value
added producer in the world. Established in 1991 by the State of Oregon, the legislature
created WPCC as a coordinating entity to devise strategies to improve and promote the
competitiveness of Oregon's secondary wood products industry. This was partially in
response to the job losses facing timber dependent communities, but also because of
global economic changes facing secondary processors. Legislation that created the
WPCC will sunset July 1, 1993, and new legislation is being drafted to create a semi­
private non-profit organization to succeed the wpcc.

WPCC has a close relationship with the private sector. Its seven member board of
directors is made up of owners or managers of secondary wood products manufacturing
finns. The board is working toward establishing programs that directly benefit that
industry. As a state agency, the WPCC also has a close relationship with state govern­
ment and coordinates with public and private organizations to avoid duplication.
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World Forestry Center,
Oregon

Contact: Pete Kent
Address: 4033 S.W. Canyon Rd.

Portland, OR 97221
Phone: (503) 228-1367
Fax: (503) 228-3624

The World Forestry Center, a nonprofit corporation, promotes the establishment,
protection, and management of forest resources through research, education, and dis­
semination of forestry information. It has a 45-member Board of Directors comprised of
representatives from private companies in countries including the United States, China,
Korea, Japan, Chile, Mexico, Norway, Australia, Indonesia, Russia, Canada, and Ger­
many. The organization is self supporting through admission fees; fees for seminars,
programs, events, conferences; publication subscription; private and corporate contribu­
tions: and other sources.

The World Forest Institute was created in 1988 as a branch of the World Forestry Center
to serve as a worldwide clearinghouse for forest information. Since it was created, it has
served clients worldwide in providing accurate and timely information on a wide variety
of forestry and forest products-related questions. The institute also sponsors an interna­
tional internship program, hosts conferences on global forestry topics, and assists world
organizations with technical communications and global distribution of forest informa­
tion.
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Appendix IV-British Columbia, Canada

Cooperative Industrial & Marketing Development Program (CIMDP),
British Columbia

Contact: Bob Holm
Address: B.C. Wood Specialties Group

Suite 1200,555 Burrord St.
Vancouver, BC. VlX lS7

Phone: (604) 684-4126
Fax: (604) 684-D216

1bis program seeks to maintain and expand international market opportunities for value­
added specialty wood products. B.C. companies involved in the secondai'y manufactur­
ing of solid wood products that are members of the B.c. Wood Specialties Group are
eligible to participate. Principally, the program encourages industry growth by improv­
ing the quality and timeliness of market and technical infonnation, providing advice, and
encouraging better utilization of resources in the manufacturing of products. Interna­
tional and domestic market development, education and traihing activities are delivered
on a cost shared basis with member companies and include the areas of: advertising,
trade shows, literature/publicity, market reseateh, product knowledge courses, hands-on,
in-plant training and missions to the marketplace. Funding for this program is 40%
federal, 40% provincial and 20% industry.

Industry and Trade
British Columbia

Contact: Bill Wilson
Address: Canadian Forest Service

Natural Resources Canada
506 West Burnside Rd.
Victoria, B.C. vaz 1M5

Phone: 604-363-0721
Fax: (604) 363-0797

Increasing the economic and social value of B.C. 's forests is the goal of this program.
To accomplish this, projects are initiated with the aim of providing the forest industry
with product and market information. 1bat is, an effort is made to provide timely
information on global markets, market opportunities, and on the structure and perfor­
mance of the B.C. forest sector. Through assessing innovative technologies and products
and developing market opportunities, the program assists in the development of second­
ary and tertiary forestry elements. It also assists in the commercialization and marketing
of teclmologies and products. .

Cooperative partnerships from industry and public agencies are eligible for the program,
and financial support is available to cost-share projects.
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Smail-SCale Forestry
BrHish Columbia

Contact: Mark Atherton
Address: Canadian Forest service

Natural Resources Canada
506 West Burnside Rd.
Victoria, Be. V8l 1M5

Phone: 604-363-0705
Fax: (604) 363-0797

Small-SCale Forestry provides funding and forestry advice to B.C.'s small-scale wood­
land owners by supporting improved plarming and sound management practices on these
woodlands. Specifically, this program is designed for anyone who owns a minimum of
10 contiguous hectares (25 acres) of productive or potentially productive forest land.
Participants in the program are drawn from both the public and private sector. Private
landowners include individuals, families, partnerships, societies and small corporations;
the public sector is comprised of cities, municipalities, regional districts, water boards,
universities and colleges, and various federal departments.

As for the means of assistance, FRDA II, through Forestry Canada's implementation,
will contribute up to 90 per cent of the eligible costs for activities carried out on the
woodland, up to a maximum of$50,000. The landowner must contribute at least 10 per
cent This contribution may be in the fonn of cash, labour, equipment or other valid
services but must be real and measurable. In addition, local civic governments, universi­
ties or colleges or federal. departments under the Small-Scale Forestry Program may
receive more than $50,000 over the tenn of the Agreement

Small Business Forest Enterprise Program
BrHish Columbia

Contact: Bob Harding
Address: Timber Harvesting Branch

B.C.. Ministry of Forests
1450 Govemment St.
Victoria, Be. V8W 3E7

Phone: 604-387-8300
Fax: (604)387-3773

Assistance to participants in this program is in the fonn of access to timber. TIle objec­
tives of this program fall into the spheres of opportunities, diversification and employ­
ment, competition and profit, and forest management. First, the program provides oppor,.
tunities to individuals and finns in the forest industry to acquire timber for their opera- c

tions and to enter the industry and establish new businesses. Secondly, the program fo­
cuses on selling timber to promote and stimulate the production of specialty and higher­
value forest products, hopefully generating increased employment through these endeav­
ors. In tenns ofcompetition and profit, timber is sold through a competitive process with
the aim ofensuring that the most efficient finns are awarded timber sales and the prov-
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ince receives a fair return for the forest resource. Finally. the program soives to demon-;
strate and encourage sound, integrated forest management throughout the province.

An individual who is at lest 19 years old or a cotpOration registered in B.C. may register
in the program as long as they meet the Small Business Forest Fnterprise Regulation
requirements. The cost of registration is $250

Woodlot Ucense Program
British Columbia

Contact: Russ Cozens
Address: limber Harvesting Branch

B.C. Ministry of Forests
3rd H, 1450 Government St.
Victoria, BC. V8W 3E7

Phone: 604-387-8308
Fax: (604) 387-3773

The Woodlot License Program offers a conditional assignment of Crown land in ex­
change for licensee management The purpose of this arrangement is to increase the
amount of private forest lands under sustained yield management, to improve the
productivity of small Crown and private forest land parcels, and to increase the opportu­
nities for citizens to be directly involved in small-scale forest management operations.

Canadian residents.who are at least nineteen years old. societies. First Nations bands or
councils. or Canadian corporations may apply for this program. However, no applicant
can own or control a cotpOration that owns a timber-processing facility and no applicant
can hold another woodlot license.

British Columbia Trade Showcase
British Columbia

Contact: Petrisha Rise
Address: B.C.. Trade Showcase

B.C.. Trade Development Corporation
601 West Cordova St.
Vancouver, BC. V6B 1G1

Phone: 604-775-0374
BC Toll Free 1-800-972-2255

The British Columbia Trade Showcase assists expon-ready B.c. manufacturers and
service companies to promote their products to foreign markets. TIlis is achieved via a
permanent trade show located in downtown Vancouver that allows companies to both
display their products and conduct business negotiations. Participating companies pay
the costs of constructing their own exhibits and a yearly rental fee in exchange for this
promotion opportunity.
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Appendix V-International

Denmatk

Danish Technologicallnstilute

Aarhus, Denmark

The Danish Technological Instirute (DTI), based in Taasoup in the Copenhagen area and
Aarhus on the Jutland Peninsula, is a national institute for applied technology develop­
ment DI1 is a participant in a national govemment program that emphisizes business
network development It is funded through public and private sources. It started out as a
training institution, but over time that function has been largely assumed by other
institutions. DTI currently provides research services to Danish firms on a contract basis,
as well as worldng on projects funded by the national govemment It receives limited
general appropriation funds to enable its staff to stay current in their technological fields.

DTI has a number of specialized industrial departments, including a wood products
department at the Aarhus facility which is engaged in furniture design and pro-cess
technology improvements. 1llis department works closely with industrial associations
and fimls in Denmark to provide assistance in technology and product design that will
aid Danish fimls in developing new products and improving current ones.

In order to effectively market its services to Danish industry, DTI relies on direct market­
ing efforts of its professional staff, who function much like the staff ofmajor U.S.
technically oriented contract research institutions such as the Battelle Memorial Institute
or SRI International. In addition, DTI works closely with Technology Information
Centers (TICs) located in each of Denmark's 14 counties. TICs are funded seperately by
the Ministry of Industry with a mission to get to know each of the manufacturing fimls in
the counties through personal visits made by staff who are experienced industrial consult­
ants. TIC staff provide several days of free consulting advice to firms on improving
process technology. Ifadditional assistance is required, the TIC staff recommends a
consultant at DTI or elsewhere who can provide the seIVice. TICs can recommend any
source of additional consulting help they think a firm needs, and they are not compelled
to recommend help from DTI.

OMI - Danish Fumiture Industry Association

1be Danish Furniture Industry Association (OMI), provides marketing and expon
seIVices to its members. They work closely with the government's network program to
assist its member with international marketing, product development, and application of
new technology.
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Storstrom County Technology Transfer Centers

Marienbergvej 80, DK-4760,
Vordingborg, Denmark

Storstrom County in southeastern Denmark is a largely rural county of250,000 people
who live in five small cities as well as on farms. The local economy was originally based
on sugar beets, food processing, and shipyards. When the shipyards closed down in the
1980s, the problem of economic development became a local as well as a national issue.
The big companies in the area had no entrepreneurial tradition and found that reevaluat­
ing their business development strategies was necessary. The people in this county now
believe that growth comes from the bottom, and the county is actively working on
business development A private, not-for-profit county small business development
center is in charge of this effort to help existing and new enterprises prosper and grow. It
works closely with the county labor market office and the adult vocational training
centers in the county. .

To improve the technology in small companies, the county has established three technol­
ogy transfer centers and a fourth "green center" to diversify agriculture. They also have
a national Technology Information Center, part of the national system administered by
the Danish Technology Institute (D11).

Storstrom County has identified some opportunities just around the comer from Den­
mark in the newly opened up countries of Eastern Europe. Denmark can use East
European companies as suppliers and strive to raise the quality of their output Interna­
tionalization is taken very seriously in Storslrom County, which is opening a county
office in Gdansk, Poland to work on environmental and education issues. The County
has links to Hungary, the Baltic states, and Germany, and is tied into the European
Information Centers network which lists private sector bid opportunities and provides
data on business advisors.

Various branches of Danish industry will be affected differently by the opening up of the
internal market within the European Community at the end of 1992, and the small
business development center in Storstrom County is developing programs to deal with
both opportunities and problems the internal market will bring. Flexible production
networks are one response to the internal market The county small business develop­
ment center brought together a group of ten furniture companies to look at marketing,
technical development, and production issues. Six of these companies have formed a
network. Their products are similar, and they want to go after large projects such as
hotels jointly. This new network got a grant from the Danish Ministry of Industry.

france

MIRCEB

A regional international trade initiative in France (MIRCEB) encourages small busi­
nesses to develop overseas business partnerships with foreign firms. MIRCEB is a
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ERVET

SVEX

quasi-goverrunental corporation established and partly funded by the regional govern-
ment of Brittany to promote international trade. .

MIRCEB is directed by a board appointed from the business community with experience
in international trade. In addition, a non-French director supervises its overseas offices in
order to give it a more international perspective. MIRCEB charges dues to its members
to help support its operations, one of which is encouraging joint ventures between Breton
firms and their counterparts in other countries. By working to match French finns with
similar finns in the U.S and other countries, MIRCEB helps build enthusiasm for export­
ing. MIRCEB operates several overseas offices, including three in the US. MIRCEB
provides trained personnel and translation services for its members. TIlis organization
also gathers financial and other information about the business environment in other
countries and helps French business managers make contacts and prepare for trips.

In Italy. the goverrunent of Emilia Romagna has chartered ERVET, a quasi-public entity
to undertake development activities. As part of its economic development activities it
provides funds for service centers. ERVET has established a number of sector service
centers to serve local industries. A substantial portion of the operating costs ofERVET
service centers are paid for through membership dues. Although this organization was
initiated by the government, the private sector is directly involved, and as a result the
industry service centers are perceived more as private sector than public sector institu­
tions. In addition to the service centers, ERVEf has been involved in developing a
curriculum to teach vocational students in the textile industry the programming of very
large scale integrated circuits (VSLIC).

ERVEf operates the Advanced Science and Technology Agency (ASTER) a multi­
sectoral program that encourages and promotes the widespread use of advanced technol­
ogy. ASTER works with a variety of industries to explore how new technologies can be
employed in traditional industries. They work towards linking new process technology­
makers to actual end-users and to adapt breakthroughs in technology to specific uses.
Their role is to extend one technology to many applications.

ERVET also operates SVEX, an export promotion program. TIlis organization was
founded in partnership between ERVET, the Chamber of Commerce, and individual
production industry associations. Italy's Emilia Romagna region has created this
international trade program to promote international relationships between Emilia
Romagna finns and finns in other countries. SVEX undertakes specific research, and
individual projects; it is not aimed at building long-term relationships, and doesn't try to
do everything or help every company. Its focus is to identify long-tenn opportunities to
build international trade between local firms and potential foreign markets.
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CAMA

Another program in Emilia Romagna is CAMA, an association of wood products
manufacturers and a member of the regional branch of the national artisans' confedera­
tion (CNA). Established in 1945, CAMA has 300 members. They operate a cooperative
warehouse that orders, purchases and stores a diverse assortment of domestic and
imported lwnber and veneer. TIle warehouse accepts phone and facsimile orders,
provides credit on materials, and delivers to finns in the local area and to some members
outside the region. CAMA's warehouse not only provides volwne discounts and ready
access for its members, but also has its own specialized machinery to provide some
custom pre-delivery shaping and cutting services.

Sweden

Snickericentral

Backgatan 7,931 34 Skelleftoo, Sweden

Snickericentral, in Skellefiea., Sweden is an example of a wood products flexible manu­
facturing network. Snickericentral, literally translated as Joinery Center, is a non-profit
corporation formed by 17 companies in 1959. This group of competitive and comple­
mentary firms preferred to concentrate on the manufacturing process rather than on
marketing, and decided to form a subsidiary to do all of their marketing. All member
firms are located near SkellefteA and VmeA in northern Sweden. An additional motiva­
tion was pooling the high costs ofmarketing in Stockholm, 850 kilometers to the south,
or points further away.

In 1990, the annual turnover of the group was about 320 million Swedish kroner (SEK),
which is equivalent to approximately $53 million US. Out of the total turnover of 320
million SEK, 70 million SEK is foreign exports. The group employs 700 people in total,
35 in the rnarlceting subsidiary. To generate 320 million SEK in sales, Snickericentral
bids on about 2 billion SEK of jobs each year. All profits generated by Snickericentral
go back to the 16 owners, less expenses of the marketing organization.

The owner companies come out of a long tradition ofjoinery in northern Sweden. At
present, the group manufactures doors, windows, institutional furniture, floors, and stairs.
They have a high state of technology, including a Computer Aided Design (CAD)
system at one company in VmeA. Earlier in their history they did a lot of residential
construction work, but after the slow housing market of the early 19805, they specialized
in their present markets plus "combination products" which use the capabilities ofmore
than one of the member companies. Examples of joint work include the interior of the
Koln (Cologne), West Germany concert hall, the woodwork for a big sports dome in
Stockholm, the airport counters at Goteborg (Gothenburg), and the interior and doors of
the Sheraton hotel in G6teborg. None of these projects would have been possible for one
of the member companies bidding in isolation due to the scale and range of components .
required. The Koln concert hall is their showpiece. The floors and walls are curved in
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more than one dimension, and each seat has a metal support whose exact position had to
be measured with laser equipment Since their own CAD system was not adequate for
the complexities of this job, they used CAD teelmology at the Trarek Research Center in
SkellefteA to design each piece of wood. The components were then manufactured in
member companies, and installed in Koln

Trainformation: Swedish TImber Council

Skogens Hus, Box 4002, 5-904 02 Ume6, Sweden

Trliinformation is a Swedish sawmill association with a regional office in UmeA in
northern Sweden, and others in the United Kingdom, Holland, France and Germany. A
sister association in Fmland participates in the foreign offices. The association does
marketing and information transfer for its 400 members. Firms pay a portion of their
revenue to the association, and the government provides some funding for specific
projects. Finns also support projects over and above their membership fees if they are
interested in the project.

The association was responsible for organizing the International Conference and Exhibi­
tion on Nordic Tunber for Joinery and Furniture, UmeA with 500 participants 1990.

sawmill Association of Southern Sweden (SABI)

The Sawmill Association ofSouthern Sweden (SAB!) is an industry association provid­
ing purchasing, marketing and financial services. A group of sawmill owners banded
together to negotiate mill residue prices with the economically powerful pulp and paper
mills. This group fonned the cooperative SABI, then set up its own transportation and
marketing arrangement to sell wood chips and other residues. The cooperative has
subsequently branched into financial and insurance services for its members as well as
export sales, and government affairs. They also negotiate the purchase price ofsaw
timber with woodlot owners in the Jonkoping region. In 1988, SABI had a staffof23
and arumal revenues ofmore than 500 million SEK ($65 million). Its 157 members pay
an annual fee based on their production. Wholly-owned SABI subsidiaries provide
financial selVices, export marketing and wood treatment

Swedish National Industrial Development Agency (SIND)

The Swedish National Industrial Development Agency, SIND, is an arm of government
Industrial design centers set up by SIND to selVe the wood-working industry, have their
budgets reviewed by the relevant industry associations and labor unions.
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Swedish Trade Council

Storgatan 19, 5-11485 Stockholm, Sweden

Swedish Trade Board (STB)

The Swedish Trade Council offers several programs to Swedish finns, including but not
limited to wood products finns. Two of these programs are especially interesting. First.
through a staff organized in seven depanments along industrial lines, it promotes and
markets the products ofSwedish finns in foreign markets. Halfof its staffof400 are
based in Stockholm; the remainder are located in major markets all over the world.

The second program is aimed at the novice exporter. The "export manager for hire"
program offers the services of an experienced export manager on a part-time and/or
temporary basis to develop an export market for a finn's products. Eaclimanager .
typically works with three to five companies at a time, for a period ofone to four years.
The Trade Council's managers emphasize that the for-hire managers act as if they are
working for the client companies, rather than for themselves as consultants or someone
else with a profit motive that differs from that of the client company. At the same time,
the flexibility of these part-time and temporary ammgements allows the finn to stay in
control of the activity, and to adjust its spending on it accordingly. The expectation is
that by the time the for-hire manager leaves a company, it will have a viable export
market that it can manage itself.

Expolaris International AB

Kanalgatan 73, 931 34 Skellette6, Sweden

Expolaris is acombination of an industrial exposition pennanently housed in downtown
SkellefteA in northern Sweden, plus a marketing consultancy representing 250 member
companies. TIley are a service organization for small scale industry and public organiza­
tions (e.g., a dental technology department of the local university) in northern Sweden.
The goal is to help the member companies penetrate international markets. They are
about to open an office in Miinchen, West Gennany to exploit opportunities in the
emerging European Cornmunity internal market As a semi-governmental organization,
they get government subsidies to put on conferences and distribute infonnation about the
region, as well as membership fees and other revenues from member companies. TIle
organization employs 15 people. two of whom are in Vmcl, a city about one hour's drive
away.

Sawmills are a major industry in the area, and Expolaris is exploring its own sales
channels for such mills to cut out intermediate dealers and brokers. That way Expolaris .
could gain more infonnation about the customers to take back to the sawmills to help
them improve their products.

78



Appendix VI - Other

New Mexico Home Catalog

Contact: Jerilou Hammett
Address: 2405 Maclovia Lane

santa Fe, NM 87501
Phone: (505) 471-4549

The New Mexico Home Catalog was formed by industry and industry observers to focus
on secondary wood products. The organization was originally formed as the New Mexico
Wood Products Association to organize the small. specialized wood products manufacrur­
ers in the state and to provide assistance in becoming more competitive. Over the last four
years the organization has published several catalogs and newsletters. The catalogs feature
firms that produce a variety of household furnishings including furniture and other wood
products. Finns pay a fee to advertise and have photos of their wares featured in this
catalog.
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Resource Materials

EasfCoast

Appalachian Export Center for Hardwoods, West Virginia University. Resource materi­
als include:

APEX Statistical Quarterly, Vol. 3(2), Summer 1992.
. Appalachian Export Centerfor Hardwoods, VoL 3, No.2, June 1992. (newslet­

ter)
1989-90 Report, 1990.
Appalachian Export Centerfor Hardwoods: Getting the Job Done. by Dr. W.

Ramsay Smith, April 1992. (Program description)
Appalachian Export Centerfor Hardwoods, May 1992. (Program Description)
"A Study of the Japanese Furniture Market," APEX Research Brief, February

1992. .
"Decision Criteria for Gennan Hardwood Buyers: Market Needs and Purchase

Requirements:' APEX Research Brief, July 1992.
"Green Movement Marketing Strategies: Opportunities for U.S. Hardwoods as

Substitutes for Tropical Species in Europe," APEX Research Brief, July 1992.
"Hardwood Lumber Exports to Canada," APEX Research Brief, July 1992.
"Mexican Hardwood Marlcet Profile: An AHEC Report," APEX Research Brief,

July 1992.
"Regional Distribution Center for Exporting Appalachian Hardwoods," APEX

Research Brief, ~uly 1992.
"Regional Distribution Center for Exporting Appalachian Hardwoods: Sensitiv­

ity Analysis," APEX Research Brief, July 1992.
'The United Kingdom Market for U.S. Hardwoods," APEX Research Brief, July

1992.

Appalachian Regional Commission. Resource materials include:
Appalachia: Twenty Years ofProgress, March 1985.
Appalachia, Journal of the Appalachian Regional Commission, Vol. 25, No.2,

Spring 1992.
Appalachia, Vol. 25, No.3, Summer 1992.
Appalachia, Vol. 25, No.4, Fa1l1992.
Appalachia, Vol25, No. I, Wmter 1992.
The Appalachian Regional Commission: Creating the Capacity to Compete.

Washington D.C. (brochure)
1990 Annual Report.
1991 Annual Report.

Bodenman, John et al, 'Success Stories' in Wood-Products Manufacturing andForest­
Resource-Based Economic Development, Pennsylvania State College of Agriculture
School of Forest Resources.

Center for Economic Development at Eastern Kentucky University. Resource materials
include:

1n Context, Vol. I, No.1, Spring 1992.
In Context, Vol. I, No.2, Summer 1992.
In Context, Vol. I, No.3, Fall 1992.
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1991-1992 Annual Report, September I, 1992-August 31,1992.
Software Demonstration Seminarfor Wood Products Mami/acturers at the

facilities ofCowart & Company, March 13, 1992. (pamphlet)

Coalition ofNortheastern Governors Policy Research Center, Inc. Resource materials
include:

How to Burn Wood Right: Choosing and using your wood stove in today's
envuo~n~1992..

Northeast Regional Biomass Program: Mission-Accomplishments- Prospects
1992, Washington D.C., October 1992.

Commonwealth ofPennsylvania Department of Commerce, A Comprehensive Bibliog­
raphy ofLogger Training Resources. Prepared by Adams, Graney & Associates for
the Governor's Response Team).

Drysdale Lee & Associates. Northeast Wood Products Expo '93, Newpex, Inc.

East Kentucky Corporation. Eastern Kentucky: The Advantagefor Wood Products
Industries. (pamphlet)

Eastern Kentucky University. Resource materials include:
Integrating CAD and CNC Routing, April2Q-22, 1992. (Pamphlet)
Kentucky Secondary Wood Manufacturers, by Albert Spencer, EKU Center for

Economic Developement, July 1992.
Resource Guide: For Corrununity, Local Gover~nt, Business, Industry, and

Economic Development Organizations, by Hanly Funderburlc, Fal11992.

Forest Products Journal articles include:
Smith. Paul and Cynthia West, "A cross-national investigation ofcompetitive

factors affecting the United States wood furniture industry," Vol. 40 Novem­
ber/December 1990, p. 39-48.

West, Cynthia and Steven Sinclair, "Technological assessment of the wood
household furniture industry," Vol. 41, No.4, April 1991, p. 11-18.

Jones, Stephen, et al., "Characteristics of hardwood manufacturers in the north­
ern and central Appalachian states." Vol. 42, No.6.

The Irland Group, Pennsylvania State. College of Agriculture, School ofForest Re­
sources. Resource materials include:

AssessmentofAdequacy ofTimber Supply and Analysis ofPotential Effects of
Eliminating the Long-tenn Timber Sale Contact Areas. Report to USDA
Forest Service, December 18, 1992.

The Grow-It-YourselfMarketfor Hardwood Products, The Irtand Group,
September 12, 1991.

Emerging Market Trends in the Cabinet Industry and Their Relevance to
Pennsylvania Economic Development. by Dr. lloyd Irland, Technical Publi­
cation No.4, October 22, 1990.

Emerging Trends in the U.S. Furniture Industry: Implicationsfor Pennsylvania
Hardwood Producers. by Dr. Lloyd Irland, Technical Publication No.3.
October 19, 1990.

The Changing Millwork Industry, by Dr. lloyd Irland, Technical Publication No.
2, October 18, 1990.

The Marketfor Hardwood Flooring: Conditioning, Competition, Trends, and
Implicationsfor Pennsylvania Producers. by Dr. Lloyd Irland, Tedmical
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Publication No.1, 1990.
Timber Demand Scenarios for Tongass National Forest 1990-2010. Report to

Alaska Region USDA Forest Service, June 23, 1992.
Value Added in the Maine Economy: Summary Report. Prepared for The Maine

Development Foundation, November 5, 1990.
Value Added in the Maine Economy: An Assessment ofValue Added Industries,

Conditions, and Trends in Maine: Technical Report, Prepared for The Maine
Development Foundation, November 5, 1990.

Jones, Stephen B. Forest Based Economic Development: Pennsylvania Situation.

Morehead State University, College of Applied Sciences.Resource materials include:

Exhibitors Guide: Tenth Anniversary Kentucky Wood Expo, Pamphlet spon­
sored by the Kentucky Forest Industries Association in cooperation with
Morehead State University, September 19-20, 1992.

Final Report: Technical Assistance to the Wood Products Industry, by Robert
Bauer, July 1991-June 1992.

Investment and Production Requirementsfor Hardwood Dimension. July 25-26
1990.

Moulder Set Up and Knife Grinding Short Course, Sponsored by Morehead
State University, Appalachian Regional Commission, & Chaney Lumber
Company, December 15-17,1992.

Wood Industry Assistance. (pamphlet of resources from this program)
Wood Industry News, Vol. I, No.3, May 1992.
Wood Industry News, Vol. 1, No.7. September 1992.
Wood Industry News, Vol. 1, No.9, November 1992.

Northeastern Forest Alliance.Resource materials include:
NEFAAlert, December 1992.

Northeast Wood Products Exposition, Inc. Membership Directory, July 1992.

Pennsylvania Department of Commerce, Economic Development Partnership, and
Hardwoods Development Council. Resource materials include:

Analysis ofUtilization ofLow Quality Logs in Pennsylvania, Prepared by Mater
Engineering, Ltd.• June 1990.

Do-It-YourselfMarkets for Hardwood Products Conference, State College.
Pennsylvania., September 6, 1991 (unpublished).

Guide to Dimension Users in Pennsylvania, Pennsylvania, OCtober 21. 1991.
Pennsylvania the Hardwood Advantage: The Competitive Advanatages of

Doing Business in Pennsylvania. Pennsylvania Economic Development·
Partnership Development of Commerce.

Pennsylvania Wood Industry Association, Resource materials include:
The Initiative, Vol. 2, No.2, May 1992.

Smith, Stephen et al, 'The Location Decision of Hardwood Manufacturing in the
Northern and Central Appalachian States," NJARE, April 1992.

Spoerke, Glenn. An Annotated literature Review ofEducational Programs and Re­
sources related to The Hardwood Industry, TIle Department of Agricultural and
Extension Education, May 1990.
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Midwest

Stanturf, John. Forest Based Economic Development: The Pennsylvania Situation.
(manuscript)

Wytheville Community College.Resource materials include:
Southwest Virginia Small Business Development Center, Small Business

Development Center at Wytheville Community College.. (brochure)
Technology Transfer and Assistance Program, When this is your Company's

playing Field, you Need a Down to Earth Advantage. (brochure)

Council ofGreat Lakes Governors, Great Lakes Regional Biomass Energy Program
FY1992 Annual Operating Plan, 1992.

Forest Products Journal articles include:
Chen, Peter, "Design and tests of a 500 BF solar kiln," March 1981, Vol. 31, No.

3, p. 33-38.
Chen, Peter et aI., "Experimental solar-dehumidifier kiln for drying lumber,"

.September 1982, Vol. 32, No.9, p. 35-41.
Chen, Peter and Charles Helton, "Design and evaluation of a low-rost solar

kiln," Vol. 39, No. I, p. 19-22.
Chen, Peter et al, "An evaluation of wood/coal pellets made in a laboratory

pelletizer," VoL 39, No.7, p. 53-58.
Chen, Peter and Yifu Tang, "Variation in longitudinal permeability of three U.S.

hardwoods," Vol. 41, No. 11/12, p. 79-88.
Chen, Peter and William Simpson, "Effects of ultrasonic cavitation on rate of

heat propagation and longitudinal permeability of three U.S. hardwoods," Vol.
42, No.4, p. 55-58.

Stewart, Harold, "High-temperature halogenation of tungsten carbide-cobalt tool
material when machinery MDF," Vol, 42, No. 10, p. 27-31.

University of illinois at Urbana-Champaign, Department ofForestry, Timber Income
Opportunities: lllinois Forest Landowners by Gene Campbell, 1989.

Forest Research Laboratory, "Proceedings of the 43rd Western Dry Kiln Association,"
May 13-15, 1992, p. 40-45.

Forward Wisconsin, Wisconsin Economic Development Marketing Corporation, Mar­
keting Plan 1992-93, 1992.

illinois Commission on Forestry Development,Resource materials include:
Forestry in lllinois Committee Reports, December 31, 1986.
Forestry in Illinois: Opportunitiesfor Action, December 31, 1986.

lllinois Council on Forestry Development, A Long-Range Pklnfor Illinois Forest
Resources Executive Summary, September 1990.

Indiana Economic Development Council, Inc. Resource materials include:
Background Paper #1 Growing Indiana's Wood Products Industry: Opportuni­

tiesfor Increasing Value-Added in Wood Products Manufacturing, December
1991.
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Growing Indiana's Wood Products Manufacturing Industry: The Competitive
Challenge, by Dr. Susan Koch, Draft of the Fmal Report to the Division of
Foresuy, Indiana Department of Natural Resources, June 4, 1992.

Industry Dynamics: The 'Competitiveness' Chapter, February 10, 1992. Pre­
pared as background for Second Advisory Panel Meeting, February 14, 1992.

Policy Recommendations: DraftofFinal Chapter, April 15, 1992, Prepared as
background for Third Advisory Panel Meeting, May 4, 1992.

Trainingfor Indiana's Wood Products Manufacturing Industry: A Report of
Training Needs and Sources. by Pat Efiom et al, April 29, 1992.

lllinois Natural History Survey. Resource materials include:
Forest ofIllinois. by L.R. Iverson et ai, Illinois Council on Forestry Develop­

ment, Urbana. and INHS, Champaign, 1991.
The Forest Resources ofIllinois: an atlas and analysis ofspatial and temporal

trends, by L.R. Iverson et ai, INHS Special Publication 11-181, 1991.

Lake States Forest Products Export Directory. Published jointly by the V.S.D.A. Forest
Service, Lake States Lumber Association. Michigan Department ofNatural Resources
Forest Management Division. Minnesota Department of Natural Resources Division of
Forestry Forest Products Utilization and Marketing, Wisconsin Department of Natural
Resources Bureau ofForestry Forest Products Unit, and Wisconsin Department of
Agriculture, Trade and Consumer Protection Marketing Division International Agri­
Business Center.

Mater Engineering Ltd, Final Report to the Wisconsin North Twenty Joint RC & D
Councils on the Wisconsin Forest Products Industry Siting Study, June 1989.

Materials Research Society, April 27-29. 1992, p. 47-63, "Materials Interactions Rel­
evant to Recycling of Wood-Based Materials," by Roger Rowell et al.

Mississippi State University, Mississippi Forest Products Lab. Resource materials
include:

"Reducing Wear of Wood Machinery Tools," Research Advances, VoL I, No.1,
March 1992.

Mississippi Forest Products Utilization Laboratory. (program description)
Mississippi Forest Products Utilization Laboratory, "Furniture Research."

Missouri Department of Conservation, Forestry Division. Resource materials include:
Missouri Forest Industries 1992: Directory ofPrimary Wood Processors,

1992.
Missouri Forest Industries 1992 Directory ofWood Drying Facilities, 1992.
1990 Directory Secondary Wood Processors, 1990. .
991 Directory ofMissouri Logging Companies, 1991.
Missouri Forest Resource Data Center. (pamphlet)

Missouri Forest Products Association.Resource materials include:
1992 Membership Directory. (booklet)

MFPA News. September-October 1992.
MFPA News. November-December 1992.

North Economic Initiatives Corporation.Resource materials include:
Secondary Wood Industrial Strategy: NEIC Case Study.
Press Release.
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Norlhwest

Purdue University
Hoover, William PhD,lndiana's Primary Wood Products Industry, Department

ofForestry and Natural Resources and the Indiana Economic Development·
Council, Inc., September 1992

"Indiana's Primary Forest Products Industry," Department ofForestry and
Natural Agricultural Experiment Station, State Bulletin No. 653, November
1992.

Southern lllinois University at Carbondale,lllinois, Forestry Sciences Laboratory:
North Central Forest Experiment Station. (pamphlet)

Stewart, Harold. "How to determine Rake Angles from Strength Properties of Wood."
(description)

The Illinois Steward, Volume I, Number 2, Spring 1992.

Wisconsin Department ofNatural Resources.Resource materials include:
The 1990 Softwood Plantation Resource in Southern Wisconsin, by Matthew

Singer, March 1991.
Survey ofExport Assistance Efforts by the Wisconsin Department ofNatural

Resources' Forest Utilization and Marketing Unit and the Wisconsin Depart­
ment ofAgriculture. Trade and Consumer Protection. by Richard Beier,
April 1992.

Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources Bureau ofForesny. Resource materials
include:

International Forest Products Transportation Study, by Richard Beier, July
1991.

Investing in Wisconsin's Forest Industry: Pulp Mill Siting Feasibility Study
Executive Swnmary, 1989.

1991 Utilization and Marketing Annual Report: Wisconsin Departmentof
Natural Resources Bureau ofForestry, 1992.

1992 Lake States Forest Products Industry Directory, 1992.
Wisconsin Wood Marketing Bulletin, January/February 1993.
Wisconsin Forest Industry News, August 1992..
Wisconsin: Primary Wood Using Industry Directory, June 1992.
Wisconsin: Secondary Wood Using Industry Directory, June 1992.
Wisconsin' s Forest Industry: The Best Kept Secret of the Century. (pamphlet)

Wisconsin LumbeJjack RC&D Council. Wisconsin Log Home Directory, March 1992.

Wood and Fiber Science, 22(4) 1990, p. 377-387, "Combustion and Emission O1aracter­
istics of Sawdust-Coal Fine Pellets," by Peter Chen & Edward Workman Jr.

Alberta Forest Products Association, Forestline, Vol. 2, No.1, March 1992.

Alberta Research Council. (Program description)

American Plywood Association. (brochure)

British Columbia Trade Development Corporation, Natural Resources Branch library,
Mona Louis, February 17, 1992.

86



British Colwnbia Wood Specialties Group. Resources materials include:
Products and Services Directory.
BCWSG Report.
The Associationfor Specialty Wood Manufacturers in British Columbia (bro­

chure).
1992 B.C. Forestry Directory. Independent Directories.

Center for International Trade in Forest Products, College ofForest Resources, Univer­
sity of Washington. ResoUrces materials include:

Northwest Wood Market: An Exhibition and Corrjerencefor Pacific Northwest
Value-Added Wood Products: A Proposal to the Northwest Area Foundation.

CINTRAFOR News, Vol. 7, No.4, October 1992.
Center for International Trade in Forest Products. (pamphlet)

Chester, Laura, "Agricultural Co-ops on Two Sides of the Globe," Puget Sound Coop­
erative Federation.

Oackamas County Development Agency, Oregon City, Oregon. (pamphlet)

Curtis, Kevin et al., Proceedings ofthe Value-Added Opportunitiesfor Alaska Forest
Products Workshop, November 1990, University of Alaska Fairbanks, Fairbanks,
Alaska.

Department of Commerce and Economic Development, State of Alaska, Division of
Business Development, Alaska Forest Products Manufacturers' Directory 1990, June
1990.

Economic Development Association of Skagit County, 1992 Annual Report, 1992.

Evergreen Partnership. (packet with program description and brochures)

Export Assistance Center of Washington, Looking to Finance Your Exports? (pamphlet)

flathead Economic Development Corporation. Resources materials include:
Final Report on the Rural Wood Products Manufacturers' Network Organiza­

tion and Marketing Assistance Program.
Forestry and Wood Products Foeus Group Proposed Action Plan, Submitted to

the Montana Science and Technology Advisory Council, April 14, 1992.
The Flathead Economic Developments, Vol. 3, NO.1.

Forestry Canada, Directory ofSecondary Wood-Using Industries in Alberta 1989, Forest
Resource Development Agreement, January 1990.

Forestry Industry Development Division, Alberta Forest Product Exports, March 1,
1992 & April 1, 1992, Alberta Forestry, Lands and Wildlife.

Gooding, Barbara, Timber PWFF Program: Public Works Trust Fund, Departmentof
Community Development. (Program description and new application packet).

Gorman, Thomas Ph.D., & Max McClintick, New Products and Marketsfor the Wood
Products Manufacturers in Clearwater County, Idaho. University of Idaho Wood Use
and Design Program, Idaho Forest, Wildlife and Range Experiment Station, WUD
Publication No. 91-1, December 1991.

Gorman, lbomas Ph.D. et aI., Directory ofIdaho Wood Products Manufacturers.
University of Idaho, Idaho Forest, Wildlife and Range Experiment Station, Miscella­
neous Publication No. 17, February 1992.
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Green, Laurie, "Company Profile: Quantum Wood Wrndows, Inc," Team Washington
News.. VoL 4, No.1, Summer 1992.

Green, Laurie, "Japan looks to Washington for Wood Pioduets," Team Washington
News.. Vol. 4, No.1, Summer 1992.

Honig, Doug, Co-op Directory.

Horsman, James, "Alberta-B.C. Players in New Economic Region," CUSBA.

Keegan, O1arles et al, Idaho's Forest Products Industry: A Descriptive Analysis 1985,
Bureau of Business and Economic Research, University ofMontana, January 1988.

di Marcello, Carol, "Organic Meat and Dairy-a Market Study," Puget Sound Cooperative
Federation.

Northwest TAAC., "Northwest TAAC can help you compete." (program description)

Oregon Economic Development Department. Opportunities for Expanding Value-Added
Wood Products Manufacturing in Southwestern Oregon: Final Report.. Prepared by
Dubal, Beck & Associates), November 27, 1991.

Oregon State University Extension Service, Timber-Dependent Families & Communities
Publications List, January 1992.

Pacific Northwest Export Assistance Project: Model Legislation Draft 1, October 1992.

Paul F. Ehinger & Associates, Review ofState Implementation ofPublic Law 101-382,
Forest Resources Conservation and Shortage ReliefAct of1990, April 1992.

Phillips, Nancye, "United They Stand," Peninsula Magazine, Winter 1991.

Puget Sound Cooperative Federation. Resources materials include:
Pamphlet & Program Description
"Co-ops can happen to you!" PCC Sound Consumer.. October 1991.
Romero, Mary Cannen, 'The 10 Principles: The Mondragon principles."

Summer 1990.

Rufolo, Anthony M & James Stratham, Secondary Wood Processing in the Pacific
Northwest: Defining the Economic Development Issues. Center for Urban Studies
School of Urban and Public Affairs, April 20, 1990.

Skagit Wood Products Cooperative Project. Economic Development Association of
Skagit County, September 1992. (Program description and newslener)

Southern Oregon Regional Economic Development. Inc., The Rogue River Valley.
(pamphlet)

Southwest Alaska Value-added Timber Manufacturing Feasibility Study, prepared for
Southeast Conference, Economic Development Center, University of Alaska South-
east. Ketchikan, June 1991. .

University of Idaho, College of Forestry. Resources materials include:
Wood Use and Design. Wildlife and Range Sciences, July 1992. (brochure)

Wood Use and Design, Wildlife and Range Sciences, March 1992. (brochure)
University ofIdaho Wood Products Academy, Wildlife and Range Sciences.

(pamphlet)
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OfherAreas

University ofIdaho Wood Use and Design Program. An Investment in the Future ofthe .
Forest Products Industry," College ofForestry, Wtldlife and Range Sciences. (pam­
phlet)

Washington State Depanrnent ofTrad·e and Economic Development Resources materi­
als include:

The Center for International Trade in Forest Products, Value-Added Wood
Products Directory 1993-94.

CERB Program, New Programfor Timber Communities. (Pamphlet and
Program Description)

Forest Products Division, Legislative Report 1992.
Value-added Forest Products Program. (pamphlet)

Washington State Governor's Timber Team, Timber Towns, A Report on Government
Services for Washington's Timber Communities, June 1992.

Washington State University Cooperative Extension, Agroforestry 1991 Project Swn­
mary: Columbia-Pacific Resource Conservation and Development Council, June
1991.

WlSbrock, Rollie, "Oregon Marketplace Revisited," Commentary, Fall 1990, p. 8-12.

WoodNet. (Program Description)

Wood Products Infonnation Center. Resources materials include:
Oregon's Secondary Wood Products First Year Project Summary Market

Development and Assistance, September 1991.
Crosscuts, Vol. 2, No.2, Spring 1992. (newsletter)
Crosscuts, Vol. 2, No. I, Wmter 1991. (newsletter)
Update, No. I, March/April 1992. (newsletter)
Wood Design Focus, Vol. 2, No.4, Wmter 1991. (newsletter)

Cortright, Joseph, Old World new Ideas: Business Assistance Lessonsfrom Europe.
. Northwest Policy Center, April 1990.

New Mexico Business Opportunity News, Vol. 3, No.8, September 1988.

New Mexico Business Opportunity News. Vol. 4, No.5, June 1988.

New Mexico Business Opportunity News, VolA. No. I, February 1989.

New Mexico Home Catalog. Resources materials include:
New Mexico Home Catalog: Resource Guide, Fme Additions, Inc., Spring

1992.
The New Mexico Supply 1992 Catalog, Fme Additions, Inc., 1992.
Lifestyle New Mexico: Christmas Catalog 1991, Fine Additions, Inc., 1991.
Once a Tree. Journal of the Wood Products Industry, Fine Additions, Inc.

Number Four, June 1990.
New Mexico Wood Products Association. New Mexico Whole House Catalog.

(A division ofFme Additions, Inc.), Spring 1991.
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U.S. Department of Agrilculture. Resources materials include:
Cooperative Extension Service Personnel in Forest Management and Wood

Products Marketing. Draft. 1992.
Renewable Natural Resources Education. A Report to Congress in the 1991­

1995 Renewable Resources Extension Program. PL 95-306. Renewable
Resources Extension Act

Renewable Natural Resources Education: Taking Care afOur Forests and
Rangelands. August 1992.

Woodworkers Business News. Vol. 1, Issue 11. February 1993. (newsletter)
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